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Andre & Son
Winfield 

Solutions
Harrell's

Seeton Turf 

Warehouse

SiteOne 
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Crop 

Production 

Services

Univar USA

A. Turfcide 5 gallon case $261.10 $261.10 No Bid $244.75 $244.76 $261.10 $280.00 $261.10 No Bid

B. Insignia SC Intrinsic Brand 4 x 30.5 oz. case $1,700.68 $1,700.68 $1,700.68
$1700.68

$1592.10
$1,700.68 $1,700.68 No Bid $1,700.68 $1,700.68

*C. Daconil Weatherstik 5 gallon case
$345.00

$190.00
$345.00 $345.00 No Bid $196.00 $273.35 $213.00 $177.90 $305.00

*D. Chipco 26GT 5 gallon case $183.75 $814.25 $406.48 No Bid $208.32 $224.10 $197.95 $182.30 $674.00

*E. Banner Maxx 2 gallon case $432.00 $432.00 $432.00 No Bid $115.14 No Bid $124.12 No Bid $432.00

*5 gallon case $241.00 $331.00 $266.24 No Bid $287.84 $322.90 $288.90 $226.30 $2,080.00

F. Tartan Stressgard 5 gallon case $1,700.00 $1,700.00 $1,980.00 $1,980.00 $1,700.00 $1,980.00 No Bid $1,700.00 $1,980.00

*G. Cleary’s 3336 F 5 gallon case
$427.00

$240.00
$448.05 $356.86 No Bid $304.80 $299.55 $211.33 $219.95 No Bid

H. Instrata 5 gallon case $800.00 $800.00 $800.00 No Bid $800.00 $800.00 No Bid $800.00 $800.00

I. Medallion SC 2 gallon case $1,120.00 $1,120.00 $1,120.00 No Bid $1,120.00 $1,120.00 $749.00 $1,120.00 $1,120.00

*J. Chipco Signature 22 pound case $280.00 $667.70 No Bid No Bid $660.00 $354.96 $306.00 $571.78 $649.00

44 pound case $1,190.00 $1,190.00 $1,133.25 $1,133.25 $1,190.00 $1,133.25 $612.00 No Bid $639.10

K. Emerald 4.9 pound case $1,568.00 $1,568.00 $1,568.00 $1,568.00 $1,568.00 $1,568.00 No Bid $1,568.00 $1,568.00

L. Segway 39.2 oz. bottle $405.00 $405.00 $405.00 $405.00 $405.00 $405.00 No Bid $405.00 No Bid

*M. Banol 1 gallon $288.00 $429.29 $589.33 No Bid $328.19 $346.48 $287.00 $297.77 $480.00

N. Xzemplar 2 x 114oz case $3,565.92 $3,565.92 $3,565.92 $3,565.92 $3,565.92 $3,565.92 No Bid $1,782.96 No Bid

O. Signature XTRA Stressgard 22 pound case $640.00 $640.00 $625.00 No Bid $640.00 $625.00 No Bid $640.00 $625.00

P. ProStar 70 WG 12 pound case $695.00 $682.68 $886.00 No Bid $793.00 $810.72 No Bid $627.12 $724.00

*Q Torque 5 x 1 gallon case $195.00 No Bid $832.00 No Bid $314.50 $349.50 $232.73 $182.84 No Bid

*R. Secure 5 gallon case
$2,940.00

$2,150.00
$2,940.00 $2,940.00 $2,750.00 $2,940.00 $2,400.00 $2,075.00 $2,940.00 $2,940.00

S. Mirage Stressgard 5 gallon case $900.00 $2,250.00 $892.50 $892.50 $900.00 $892.50 No Bid $900.00 $892.50

I.   FUNGICIDES: 

Purchase of Pesticides, Plant Growth Regulators & Grass Seed
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A. Triple Crown Golf 1 gallon bottle $220.25 $220.00 $215.00 $210.00 $220.00 $215.00 No Bid $220.00 $215.00

B. Conserve SC 1 gallon bottle $145.00 $473.12 $626.76 No Bid $444.00 $123.53 No Bid $95.14 No Bid

*C. Sevin SL 5 gallon case $178.00 $179.80 No Bid No Bid $212.04 $199.20 $190.00 $182.35 $190.00

*D. Scimitar GC 8 quart case
$981.00

$440.00
$1,090.56 No Bid No Bid $394.56 $484.08 $299.00 $479.92 $1,158.00

E. Acelepryn 4 x 0.5 gallon case $3,910.00 $3,910.00 $3,910.00 No Bid $3,910.00 $3,910.00 No Bid $3,910.00 $3,910.00

F. Dylox 420 SL 2 x 2.5 gallon case $301.00 $356.55 No Bid No Bid $390.00 $371.75 $335.00 $332.35 $348.00

G. Provaunt 1 x 120 oz. bottle $852.00 $852.00 $852.00 No Bid $852.00 $852.00 No Bid $852.00 $852.00

*H. Dursban 5 gallon case $235.00 $300.05 No Bid No Bid $265.90 $287.60 No Bid $247.05 $246.00

*A. Banvel 5 gallon case $435.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $432.70 $107.00 $262.45 No Bid

B. Speedzone Red 5 gallon case $350.00 $346.50 $445.46 No Bid $449.02 $388.25 No Bid $346.90 No Bid

*C. Roundup Pro 5 gallon case
$110.00

$64.00
$97.45 No Bid No Bid $123.80 $78.65 $68.00 $64.95 $97.00

D. Dimension 2EW 5 gallon case
$1,050.00

$630.00
$1,050.00 $1,157.50 No Bid $1,050.00 $1,055.90 $1,123.50 $1,050.00 No Bid

E. Quick Silver 8 oz. bottle $112.00 $126.51 $180.27 No Bid $134.00 $120.00 $138.06 $122.80 $135.60

F. Tupersan WP 48 lb. case $1,305.00 $1,371.36 No Bid No Bid $1,514.16 No Bid No Bid $1,343.52 $1,384.00

G. Lontrel 32 oz. bottle $149.00 $152.42 $205.92 No Bid $172.55 $174.71 No Bid $148.84 No Bid

H. Drive 64 oz. bottle $58.00 $40.74 $81.55 No Bid $57.47 $62.35 $229.00 $44.12 $66.90

I. Sedge Hammer 1.3 oz. bottle $83.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.38 $89.25 $96.00 $61.10 No Bid

J. Tenacity 1 gallon $768.00 $768.00 $768.00 $360.00 $768.00 $761.00 No Bid $768.00 $768.00

*A. Primo Maxx 10 gallon link pack
$2,740.00

$995.00
$2,740.00 $2,740.00 No Bid

$1368.00

$2740.00
$1,240.70 $1,011.00 No Bid $2,740.00

*B. Primo Maxx 2 gallon case
$580.00

$201.00
$580.00

$580.00

$305.06
No Bid $276.00 $214.92 $202.00 $411.40 $580.00

C. Proxy 5 gallon case $165.00 $197.15 $187.26 No Bid $165.46 $390.02 $147.00 $139.95 $176.80

D. Anuew 1.5 LB package $97.50 $97.50 $97.50 $97.50 $97.50 $97.50 No Bid $97.50 No Bid

*E. Trimmit 2SC 5 gallon case
$2,025.00

$650.00
$2,025.00

$2,025.00

$1,109.45
$795.00 $2,025.00 $949.40 $802.00 $610.56 $2,025.00

II.   INSECTICIDES:

III.   HERBICIDES:

IV.   PLANT GROWTH REGULATORS
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*A. 3 Way Bentgrass Blend Price per pound $6.40 $6.95 $8.73 No Bid $8.59 $8.52 No Bid $6.74 No Bid

*B. GLS Resistant Tri Rye Grass Price per pound $1.19 $74.34 No Bid No Bid $1.496 $1.29 $1.34 $1.23 No Bid

*C. L-93 Creeping Bentgrass Price per pound
$232.00

$190.00
$13.13 $10.95 No Bid $6.173 $10.86 $11.55 $10.85 No Bid

D. T-1 Bentgrass Price per pound $10.90 $13.43 $12.80 $9.22 $11.705 No Bid $13.75 No Bid No Bid

E. Kentucky Bluegrass – LOW MOW Price per pound $1.96 $3.73 $3.40 No Bid $2.999 $2.67 No Bid $2.49 No Bid

F. Early Bird 3-0-1 50lb bag or 2.5 gal $46.00 $125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

G. 30-0-20 Tyler Bent Special (Soluble) Per 25 pound bag $21.00 $27.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

*H. 30-0-0 Lebanon 100% MESA

SGN 200 or under
Per 50 pound bag

$24.95

$27.00
No Bid $51.00 No Bid $29.71 No Bid $25.00 No Bid No Bid

*I. 18-0-14 with 60% Nutralene

90 SGN
Per 50 pound bag $32.00 $40.73 No Bid No Bid $25.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

*J. Rough Mix: (or similar blend) Price per pound $1.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.902 $1.92 $1.47 No Bid No Bid

30% Creeping Red Fescue

25% Kentucky Bluegrass

20% Chewings Fescue

15% GLS Resistant Perennial Ryegrass

10% Hard Fescue

K. 21-0-0 Ammorium Sulfate Mini Per 50 pound bag $14.00 $18.61 $16.74 No Bid $776.80 $14.92 $20.00 No Bid No Bid

*L. 46-0-0 UFlex or UMAXX Per 50 pound bag
$24.00

$26.00
$26.89 $37.21 No Bid No Bid $34.10 $31.50 $19.50 No Bid

M. 21-0-0 Ammorium Sulfate (Soluble)

Lesco Solugreen
Per 50 pound bag $15.75 No Bid $20.12 No Bid $12.94 $15.98 $21.00 $15.95 No Bid

*N. 19-26-5 Starter Fertilizer                         Per 50 pound bag $17.75 $35.72 No Bid No Bid $18.91 No Bid No Bid $36.95 No Bid

*O. 28-0-3 w/Dimension/Acelepryn Per 50 pound bag $82.00 $80.30 $80.24 No Bid $79.00 No Bid No Bid $69.49 No Bid

P. Urea (soluble) Per 50 pound bag $15.90 $16.75 No Bid No Bid $15.52 $16.18 $18.00 $15.24 No Bid

Q.
Iron Sulfate (soluble) Manganese 

Sulfate
Per 50 pound bag $17.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.57 $21.20 $23.50 $18.00 No Bid

R. (Soluble) Per 50 pound bag $41.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.54 $43.12 No Bid $89.00 No Bid

*S. Turf Screen Per 5 gallon case $530.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $960.00 $530.00 $530.00 $337.50 No Bid

T. 9-0-18 Andersons Contec DG Pro SGN 

under 100
Per 40 pound bag $51.90 $52.40 No Bid $52.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

U. Black Pond Dye Per 6 X 5.25oz $35.00 No Bid $103.69 No Bid $836.80 $360.00 No Bid $283.90 No Bid

V. 18-0-18 Andersons Contec DG Pro 

SGN under 100
Per 40 pound bag $52.30 $52.80 No Bid $52.80 $45.40 No Bid No Bid $52.80 No Bid

W. Pigment Cleaner Per 4 gallon case $250.00 No Bid $199.12 No Bid No Bid $250.00 No Bid $106.00 No Bid

V.   GRASS SEED & FERTILIZER
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*A. Cascade Plus Per 5 gallon case $320.00 $451.55 $473.40 $410.00 $168.06 $435.00 $395.00 $337.50 No Bid

*B. Duplex Ultra Per 5 gallon case $260.00 $320.15 No Bid $349.00 $238.74 $258.86 $395.00 $89.75 No Bid

VI.   WETTING AGENT
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