
Bid Title: Purchase of Plow Blades/Shoes and Salt Spreader Chains

Contact: John Sullivan, Highway

Expanded Supply 

Products

Wear Parts & 

Equipment 
Chemung Supply

American 

Material 

Processing

Steel Sales Inc.
Winter 

Equipment Co.

Y Y Y Y Y

Y Y Y Y Y

Y Y Y Y Y

Y Y Y Y Y

Y Y Y Y Y

Y Y Y Y Y

Y Y Y Y Y

Y Y Y Y Y

7-14 days 10-130 days 21 days 21 days 3-21 days

$130.68 $107.50 $94.69 NO BID $77.95

$157.64 $128.87 $113.64 $139.00 $131.95

$163.64 $179.26 $168.95 NO BID $155.00

$122.73 $134.59 $126.72 NO BID $116.00

$23.75 NO BID $25.50 $23.70 $24.50

$23.75 NO BID $25.50 $23.70 $24.50

$23.75 NO BID $25.50 $23.70 $24.50

$23.75 NO BID $25.50 $23.70 $24.50

$26.32 NO BID $26.95 NO BID $29.50

State Percentage: State Percentage
State Percentage

20%
State Percentage State Percentage State Percentage

$73.75

$72.95

$102.70

$28.06

NO BID

SEE BID

d. 21 ¼” center to center:

c. 21 1/16” center to center:

a. 20 1/2” center to center:

b. 21” center to center:

0% 30.5% NO BID0%

6. Spreader Chains: pintle link: D88K

7. Snow Plow Shoes: Moldboard

8. Snow Plow Shoes: Wing Shoe

9. Frame Shoe-one way

10. Nosepiece

Delivery < 21 days

W-9

Gifts Statement

Iranian Divestment Certification 

Bidders Check List

BIDDERS  →  →  →  → 

Proposal - Signed & Duplicated 

NO BID

1. Steel Snow Plow Blade Edges: 1” x 8” x 5’

2. Steel Snow Plow Blade Edges: 1” x 8” x 6’

3. Carbide Insert Blade: 3/4” x 6” x 4’-6 hole

4. Carbide Insert Blade: ¾”x6”x3’-5 hole

5. Spreader Chains: pintle link: 667X

RFB-2017-089

Non-Collusion Bidding Certificates

Insurance Acknowledgement

Election Law Statement

Opening Date: Wednesday, October 25, 2017


