
Bid Title: 

Bid No. 

Contact:

Vander Molen 

Fire Apparatus 

Sales & Services

J.P.B. Fire Sales
JPJ Electronic 

Communications

Municipal 

Emergency 

Services

DiVal Safety & 

Supplies

Y Y Y Y Y

Y Y Y Y Y

NONE Y NONE NONE Y

Y Y Y Y Y

Y Y Y Y Y

Y Y Y Y Y

Y Y Y Y Y

Y Y Y Y Y

Y Y Y Y Y

Y Y Y Y Y

Y Y Y Y Y

Y Y Y NO NO

 Y Y NO Y YAddendum No. 4

Addendum No. 3

Addendum No. 1

Addendum No. 2

Vehicle Procurement Specification Index B, Class 4 Aircraft Rescure Fire-Fighting 

(ARFF) Equipment

RFB-2017-018

Bidders Check List

BIDDERS - →  →  →  →  → 

Proposal - Signed & Duplicated 

Non-Collusion Bidding Certificates

Insurance Acknowledgement

Election Law Statement

Opening Date: 

Mark Heefner

Wednesday, April 05, 2017

Variation & Justification

W-9

Gifts Statement

Iranian Divestment Certification 



Bid Title: 

Bid No. 

Vander Molen 

Fire Apparatus 

Sales & Services

J.P.B. Fire Sales
JPJ Electronic 

Communications

Municipal 

Emergency 

Services

DiVal Safety & 

Supplies

NO BID $31,425.00 NO BID $35,284.86 $31,577.00

NO BID NO BID NO BID $78,700.05 $77,790.00

NO BID NO BID NO BID $14,700.00 $24,240.00

NO BID NO BID NO BID $3,690.00 $3,615.00

NO BID $4,757.50 NO BID $5,937.00 $5,250.00

$14,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID $6,632.31 NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID $241.53 NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID $176.40 NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID $1,225.50 NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID $1,177.26 NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID $138.59 NO BID NO BID

Installation: 

$750.00

Total Cost: 

$10,341.59

BIDDERS - →  →  →  →  → 

e) Total Cost -- Icom A120 Radio & Accessories

a) Total Cost -- Harris Unity XG-100M Radio

b) Total Cost -- Harris 136-870 MHz antenna

c) Total Cost -- Harris 30-35 MHz NMO antenna

d) Total Cost -- Harris XG-100M Cables & Software

Vehicle Procurement Specification Index B, Class 4 Aircraft Rescure Fire-Fighting 

(ARFF) Equipment

RFB-2017-018

Bid Package # 5

f) Total Cost -- Icom A120 Cables & Software

Bid Package # 4

a) Total Cost

b) 30 Bottles - Total Cost

c) 15 Masks - Total Cost

Bid Package # 3

a) Total Cost

Bid Package # 1

Bid Package # 2

a) 15 Packs - Total Cost

a) Total Cost


