





BID TITLE: PESTICIDES, PLANT GROWTH REGULATORS & GRASS SEED
BID NUMBER: 2015-010
BID OPENING: WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 11, 2015
DEPARTMENT: DPW – EN-JOIE GOLF COURSE

 BIDDERS NAME:	Metro Turf Specialists	Helena Chemical	Winfield Solutions	Harrells
Non-Collusive Bidding Certificate Signed?	OK	OK	OK	OK
Proposal Signed & Duplicated?	OK	OK	OK	OK
Variation & Justification Sheet Enclosed?	NA	NA	OK	NA
Insurance Acknowledgement Signed?	OK	OK	OK	OK
Election Law Statement Completed & Signed?	OK	OK	OK	OK
Gifts Statement Completed & Signed?	OK	OK	OK	OK
Bidders Checklist Completed & Signed?	OK	OK	OK	OK
Insurance Certificate Enclosed?	OK	NO	NO	NO
W-9 Completed & Signed?	OK	OK	OK	OK

BID TITLE: PESTICIDES, PLANT GROWTH REGULATORS & GRASS SEED
BID NUMBER: 2015-010
BID OPENING: WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 11, 2015
DEPARTMENT: DPW – EN-JOIE GOLF COURSE

 BIDDERS NAME:	John Deere Landscape	Andre & Son	Central Garden Pennington Seed & Inc.	Crop Production Services
Non-Collusive Bidding Certificate Signed?	OK	OK	OK	OK
Proposal Signed & Duplicated?	OK	OK	OK	OK
Variation & Justification Sheet Enclosed?	OK	NA	NA	NA
Insurance Acknowledgement Signed?	OK	OK	OK	OK
Election Law Statement Completed & Signed?	OK	OK	OK	OK
Gifts Statement Completed & Signed?	OK	OK	OK	OK
Bidders Checklist Completed & Signed?	OK	OK	OK	OK
Insurance Certificate Enclosed?	NO	NO	NO	OK
W-9 Completed & Signed?	OK	OK	OK	OK
				

BID TITLE: PESTICIDES, PLANT GROWTH REGULATORS & GRASS SEED
BID NUMBER: 2015-010
BID OPENING: WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 11, 2015
DEPARTMENT: DPW – EN-JOIE GOLF COURSE

BIDDERS NAME: 	Northeast Pro Turf			
Non-Collusive Bidding Certificate Signed?	OK			
Proposal Signed & Duplicated?	OK			
Variation & Justification Sheet Enclosed?	OK			
Insurance Acknowledgement Signed?	OK			
Election Law Statement Completed & Signed?	OK			
Gifts Statement Completed & Signed?	OK			
Bidders Checklist Completed & Signed?	OK			
Insurance Certificate Enclosed?	OK			
W-9 Completed & Signed?	OK			

BROOME COUNTY
DIVISION OF PURCHASING
PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

*** You may bid a substitute – Specify which item is being bid.
(Substitutes may not necessarily be awarded)**

I. FUNGICIDES:

A.	Insignia	9.6 pound case	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
B.	Insignia SC Intrinsic Brand	4 x 30.5 oz. case	\$ <u>1573⁸⁰</u>
*C.	Daconil Weatherstik Q.P. Chlorothaloxyl 720 F10	5 gallon case	\$ <u>141⁹⁵</u>
*D.	Chipco 26GT Q.P. E-Pro	5 gallon case	\$ <u>212⁰⁰</u>
*E.	Banner Maxx Q.P. Propiconazole	2 gallon case	\$ <u>139⁰⁰</u>
		10 gallon link pack 2 x 2 1/2 GL	\$ <u>298⁷⁵</u>
F.	Curalan EG	33 pound keg	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
	OR		
	Touche EG	33 pound keg	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
*G.	Cleary's 3336 F Q.P. TM 4.5 F10	5 gallon case	\$ <u>288⁰⁰</u>
H.	Instrata	5 gallon case	\$ <u>790⁰⁰</u>
I.	Medallion 50 WP	2 pound case	\$ <u>653⁸⁵</u>
*J.	Chipco Signature Q.P. Fosetyl-Al	22 pound case	\$ <u>349⁰⁰</u>
K.	Emerald	4.9 pound case	\$ <u>1450⁴⁰</u>
L.	Segway	39.2 oz.	\$ <u>365⁷⁵</u>
*M.	Banol	1 gallon	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
N.	Bayleton Flo	5 gallon case	\$ <u>3000⁰⁰</u>
O.	Chipco Triton Flo	4 gallon case	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
*P.	ProStar 70 WDG	12 pound case	\$ <u>736⁰⁰</u>

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

*Q.	Torque O.P. Tobaccozole	5 x 1 gallon case	\$ <u>347⁵⁰</u>
R.	Secure	5 gallon case	\$ <u>2825⁰⁰</u>
S.	Sync Fung Activator	12 x 16 oz. bottle case	\$ <u>No Bid</u>

II. INSECTICIDES:

*A.	Merit 75 WSP O.P. Imidacloprid	1.6 pound case	\$ <u>82²⁵</u>
*B.	Merit 75 WSP	mega mini-drum 88 x 1.6 oz	\$ <u>425⁹⁵</u>
*C.	Sevin SL	5 gallon case	\$ <u>195⁰⁰</u>
*D.	Scimitar GC	8 quart case	\$ <u>447²⁰</u>
E.	O.P. Lambda Acelepryn	4 x 0.5 gallon case	\$ <u>3710⁰⁰</u>

III. HERBICIDES:

*A.	Banvel	5 gallon case	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
B.	Speedzone Red	5 gallon case	\$ <u>↓</u>
*C.	Roundup Pro	5 gallon case	\$ <u>↓</u>
D.	Dimension 2EW	5 gallon case	\$ <u>1095⁰⁰</u>
E.	Quick Silver	8 oz. bottle	\$ <u>151²⁰</u>
F.	Tupersan WP	48 lb. case	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
G.	Lontrel	32 oz. bottle	\$ <u>188⁴⁵</u>
H.	SquareOne	8 oz. bottle	\$ <u>60⁷⁵</u>
I.	Treflan G	40 pound bag	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
J.	Tenacity	1 gallon	\$ <u>747⁰⁰</u>

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

IV. PLANT GROWTH REGULATORS

*A.	Primo Maxx O.P., T-Nex	10 gallon link pack 2 x 2 1/2 GL	\$ <u>555.75</u>
*B.	Primo Maxx	2 gallon case	\$ <u>233.45</u>
C.	Proxy	5 gallon case	\$ <u>185.00</u>

V. GRASS SEED & FERTILIZER

*A.	3 Way Bentgrass Blend	Price per pound	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
*B.	GLS Resistant Tri Rye Grass	Price per pound	\$ <u> </u>
*C.	L-93 Creeping Bentgrass	Price per pound	\$ <u> </u>
D.	T-1 Bentgrass	Price per pound	\$ <u> </u>
E.	Alpha Bentgrass	Price per pound	\$ <u> </u>
F.	Kentucky Bluegrass - LOW MOW	Price per pound	\$ <u> </u>
G.	25-0-5 Lebanon 51% MESA 200 SGN or under Nitrate 28-0-8	50 pound bag	\$ <u>28.85</u>
H.	30-0-0 Lebanon 100% MESA SGN 200 or under	50 pound bag	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
*I.	16-4-8 Ammonium Sulfate, 1% Iron, 145 SGN Nitrate 14-0-12	50 pound bag	\$ <u>51.95</u>
*J.	Rough Mix: (or similar blend) 30% Creeping Red Fescue; 25% Kentucky Bluegrass; 20% Chewings Fescue; 15% GLS Resistant Perennial Ryegrass; 10% Hard Fescue	Price per pound	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
K.	21-0-0 Ammorium Sulfate Mini	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
*L.	0-0-50 Polyon Micro Nitrate	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>34.75</u>
M.	21-0-0 Ammorium Sulfate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>19.95</u>
*N.	19-26-5 Starter Fertilizer 14-24-12	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>19.95</u>
O.	Potassium Nitrate (soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>No Bid</u>

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

P.	Urea (soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>21⁹⁵</u>
Q.	Iron Sulfate (soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>NO Bid</u>
R.	Manganese Sulfate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>↓</u>
S.	Turf Screen	5 gallon case	\$ <u>↓</u>
T.	Calcium Nitrate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>↓</u>
U.	0-52-34 Mono-Potassium Phosphate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>5775</u>
V.	18-0-18 Andersons DG Pro SGN under 100 <i>note 17.0-17</i>	Per 40 pound bag	\$ <u>4585</u>

VI. **WETTING AGENT**

A.	Fleet	5 gallon case	\$ <u>NO Bid</u>
B.	Lesco Flo	5 gallon case	\$ <u>↓</u>

The form of proposal as issued by the Purchasing Agent shall not be changed or added to by the bidder. It shall be completely filled in with black ink or typed. With respect to prices or other submissions filled in by the bidder in blank spaces, there shall be no erasures, cross-outs, correction fluid or the like unless initialed by the person signing the proposal.

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

HARELLS

BROOME COUNTY
DIVISION OF PURCHASING
PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

*** You may bid a substitute – Specify which item is being bid.
(Substitutes may not necessarily be awarded)**

I. FUNGICIDES:

A.	Insignia	9.6 pound case	\$ <u>xxxxxx</u>
B.	Insignia SC Intrinsic Brand	4 x 30.5 oz. case	\$ <u>1,573.80</u>
*C.	Daconil Weatherstik	5 gallon case	\$ <u>292.50</u>
*D.	Chipco 26GT	5 gallon case	\$ <u>620.00</u>
*E.	Banner Maxx	2 gallon case	\$ <u>428.00</u>
		10 gallon link pack	\$ <u>2,060.00</u>
F.	Curalan EG	33 pound keg	\$ <u>1,080.00</u>
	or		
	Touche EG	33 pound keg	\$ <u>xxxxxx</u>
*G.	Cleary's 3336 F (Cavalier)	5 gallon case	\$ <u>304.00</u>
H.	Instrata	5 gallon case	\$ <u>790.00</u>
I.	Medallion 50 WP	2 pound case	\$ <u>654.00</u>
*J.	Chipco Signature	44 pound case	\$ <u>1,111.00</u>
K.	Emerald	4.9 pound case	\$ <u>1,450.40</u>
L.	Segway	39.2 oz.	\$ <u>395.00</u>
*M.	Banol	5 gallon	\$ <u>1,850.00</u>
N.	Bayleton Flo	5 gallon case	\$ <u>3,000.00</u>
O.	Chipco Triton Flo	4 gallon case	\$ <u>xxxxxx</u>
*P.	ProStar 70 WDG	12 pound case	\$ <u>612.00</u>

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

HARRELLS

PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

*Q.	Torque	5 x 1 gallon case	\$ <u>780.00</u>
R.	Secure	5 gallon case	\$ <u>2,825.00</u>
S.	Sync Fung Activator	12 x 16 oz. bottle case	\$ <u>xxxxx</u>

II. INSECTICIDES:

*A.	Merit 75 WSP	1.6 pound case	\$ <u>xxxxx</u>
*B.	Merit 75 WSP	mega mini-drum	\$ <u>1,250.00</u>
*C.	Sevin SL	5 gallon case	\$ <u>xxxxx</u>
*D.	Scimitar GC	8 quart case	\$ <u>xxxxx</u>
E.	Acelepryn	4 x 0.5 gallon case	\$ <u>1,855.00</u>

III. HERBICIDES:

*A.	Banvel	5 gallon case	\$ <u>xxxxx</u>
B.	Speedzone Red	5 gallon case	\$ <u>xxxxx</u>
*C.	Roundup Pro	5 gallon case	\$ <u>xxxxx</u>
D.	Dimension 2EW	5 gallon case	\$ <u>xxxxx</u>
E.	Quick Silver	8 oz. bottle	\$ <u>xxxxx</u>
F.	Tupersan WP	48 lb. case	\$ <u>xxxxx</u>
G.	Lontrel	32 oz. bottle	\$ <u>xxxxx</u>
H.	SquareOne	8 oz. bottle	\$ <u>xxxxx</u>
I.	Treflan G	40 pound bag	\$ <u>xxxxx</u>
J.	Tenacity	1 gallon	\$ <u>747.00</u>

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

IV. PLANT GROWTH REGULATORS

* A.	Primo Maxx	10 gallon link pack	\$ <u>2,740.00</u>
* B.	Primo Maxx	2 gallon case	\$ <u>566.00</u>
C.	Proxy	5 gallon case	\$ <u>xxxxx</u>

V. GRASS SEED & FERTILIZER

* A.	3 Way Bentgrass Blend	Price per pound	\$ <u>4.95</u>
* B.	GLS Resistant Tri Rye Grass	Price per pound	\$ <u>2.55</u>
* C.	L-93 Creeping Bentgrass	Price per pound	\$ <u>7.95</u>
D.	T-1 Bentgrass	Price per pound	\$ <u>12.50</u>
E.	Alpha Bentgrass	Price per pound	\$ <u>11.75</u>
F.	Kentucky Bluegrass - LOW MOW	Price per pound	\$ <u>2.95</u>
G.	25-0-5 Lebanon 51% MESA 200 SGN or under	50 pound bag	\$ <u>xxxxxx</u>
H.	30-0-0 Lebanon 100% MESA SGN 200 or under	50 pound bag	\$ <u>xxxxxx</u>
* I.	16-4-8 Ammonium Sulfate, 1% Iron, 145 SGN	50 pound bag	\$ <u>xxxxx</u>
* J.	Rough Mix: (or similar blend) 30% Creeping Red Fescue; Gameday 25% Kentucky Bluegrass; 20% Chewings Fescue; 15% GLS Resistant Perennial Ryegrass; 10% Hard Fescue	Price per pound	\$ <u>2.45</u>
K.	21-0-0 Ammorium Sulfate Mini	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>xxxxx</u>
* L.	0-0-50 Polyon Micro	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>57.00</u>
M.	21-0-0 Ammorium Sulfate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>xxxxxx</u>
* N.	19-26-5 Starter Fertilizer	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>xxxxxx</u>
O.	Potassium Nitrate (soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>xxxxxx</u>

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

P.	Urea (soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>xxxxx</u>
Q.	Iron Sulfate (soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>xxxxx</u>
R.	Manganese Sulfate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>xxxxx</u>
S.	Turf Screen ParSG	5 gallon case	\$ <u>1,100.00</u>
T.	Calcium Nitrate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>xxxxx</u>
U.	0-52-34 Mono-Potassium Phosphate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	<u>\$xxxxx</u>
V.	18-0-18 Andersons DG Pro SGN under 100	Per 40 pound bag	<u>\$xxxxx</u>

VI. **WETTING AGENT**

A.	Fleet	5 gallon case	\$ <u>425.00</u>
B.	Lesco Flo	5 gallon case	\$ <u>xxxxx</u>

The form of proposal as issued by the Purchasing Agent shall not be changed or added to by the bidder. It shall be completely filled in with black ink or typed. With respect to prices or other submissions filled in by the bidder in blank spaces, there shall be no erasures, cross-outs, correction fluid or the like unless initialed by the person signing the proposal.

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

BROOME COUNTY
DIVISION OF PURCHASING
PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

* You may bid a substitute – Specify which item is being bid.
(Substitutes may not necessarily be awarded)

I. FUNGICIDES:

A.	Insignia	9.6 pound case	\$ <u>no bid</u>
B.	Insignia SC Intrinsic Brand	4 x 30.5 oz. case	\$ <u>1513.80</u>
*C.	Daconil Weatherstik <i>Daconil w/s</i>	5 gallon case	\$ <u>292.50</u>
*D.	Chipco 26GT <i>Ipro 2SE</i>	5 gallon case	\$ <u>195.00</u>
*E.	Banner Maxx <i>Propiconazole</i>	2 gallon case	\$ <u>126.96</u>
	<i>Banner Maxx</i>	10 gallon link pack	\$ <u>2060.00</u>
F.	Curalan EG	33 pound keg	\$ <u>959.00</u>
	or		
	Touche EG	33 pound keg	\$ <u>no bid</u>
*G.	Cleary's 3336 F <i>T-methyl</i>	5 gallon case	\$ <u>232.95</u>
H.	Instrata	5 gallon case	\$ <u>790.00</u>
I.	Medallion 50 WP	2 pound case	\$ <u>592.00</u>
*J.	Chipco Signature <i>Signature</i>	22 pound case	\$ <u>605.00</u>
K.	Emerald	4.9 pound case	\$ <u>1440 1450.40 Am</u>
L.	Segway	39.2 oz.	\$ <u>395.00</u>
*M.	Banol <i>Proplant</i>	1 gallon	\$ <u>330.00</u>
N.	Bayleton Flo	5 gallon case	\$ <u>3,000.00</u>
O.	Chipco Triton Flo	4 gallon case	\$ <u>no bid</u>
*P.	ProStar 70 WDG <i>Prostar</i>	12 pound case	\$ <u>682.00</u>

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

*Q.	Torque	Mirage	5 x 1 gallon case	\$ 815.00
R.	Secure		5 gallon case	\$ 2,825.00
S.	Sync Fung Activator		12 x 16 oz. bottle case	\$ N/B

II. INSECTICIDES:

*A.	Merit 75 WSP	critenion	1.6 pound case	\$ 82.88
*B.	Merit 75 WSP	merit	mega mini-drum	\$ 1,250.00
*C.	Sevin SL	Sevin	5 gallon case	\$ 125.00
*D.	Scimitar GC	Lambda	8 quart case	\$ 428.00
E.	Acelepryn		4 x 0.5 gallon case	\$ 3,710.00

III. HERBICIDES:

*A.	Banvel	Banvel	5 gallon case	\$ 480.00
B.	Speedzone Red		5 gallon case	\$ 345.00
*C.	Roundup Pro	Ranger Pro	5 gallon case	\$ 75.00
D.	Dimension 2EW		5 gallon case	\$ 950.00
E.	Quick Silver		8 oz. bottle	\$ 120.00
F.	Tupersan WP		48 lb. case	\$ 1,289.30
G.	Lontrel		32 oz. bottle	\$ 152.00
H.	SquareOne		8 oz. bottle	\$ 54.00
I.	Treflan G		40 pound bag	\$ 28.00
J.	Tenacity		1 gallon	\$ 747.00

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

IV. PLANT GROWTH REGULATORS

*A.	Primo Maxx	Primo	10 gallon link pack	\$ 2,740.00
*B.	Primo Maxx	T-nex	2 gallon case	\$ 252.00
C.	Proxy		5 gallon case	\$ 175.00

V. GRASS SEED & FERTILIZER

*A.	3 Way Bentgrass Blend		Price per pound	\$ NO Bid
*B.	GLS Resistant Tri Rye Grass		Price per pound	\$
*C.	L-93 Creeping Bentgrass		Price per pound	\$
D.	T-1 Bentgrass		Price per pound	\$
E.	Alpha Bentgrass		Price per pound	\$
F.	Kentucky Bluegrass - LOW MOW		Price per pound	\$
G.	25-0-5 Lebanon 51% MESA 200 SGN or under		50 pound bag	\$
H.	30-0-0 Lebanon 100% MESA SGN 200 or under		50 pound bag	\$
*I.	16-4-8 Ammonium Sulfate, 1% Iron, 145 SGN		50 pound bag	\$
*J.	Rough Mix: (or similar blend) 30% Creeping Red Fescue; 25% Kentucky Bluegrass; 20% Chewings Fescue; 15% GLS Resistant Perennial Ryegrass; 10% Hard Fescue		Price per pound	\$
K.	21-0-0 Ammorium Sulfate Mini		Per 50 pound bag	\$ 12.75
*L.	0-0-50 Polyon Micro		Per 50 pound bag	\$ NO bid
M.	21-0-0 Ammorium Sulfate (Soluble)		Per 50 pound bag	\$ 15.90
*N.	19-26-5 Starter Fertilizer 16-19-10		Per 50 pound bag	\$ 16.50
O.	Potassium Nitrate (soluble)		Per 50 pound bag	\$ 39.45

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

P.	Urea (soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>18.10</u>
Q.	Iron Sulfate (soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>18.70</u>
R.	Manganese Sulfate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>no bid</u>
S.	Turf Screen	5 gallon case	\$ <u>no bid</u>
T.	Calcium Nitrate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>24.25</u>
U.	0-52-34 Mono-Potassium Phosphate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>no bid</u>
V.	18-0-18 Andersons DG Pro SGN under 100	Per 40 pound bag	\$ <u>no bid</u>

VI. WETTING AGENT

A.	Fleet	5 gallon case	\$ <u>no bid</u>
B.	Lesco Flo	5 gallon case	\$ <u>no bid</u>

The form of proposal as issued by the Purchasing Agent shall not be changed or added to by the bidder. It shall be completely filled in with black ink or typed. With respect to prices or other submissions filled in by the bidder in blank spaces, there shall be no erasures, cross-outs, correction fluid or the like unless initialed by the person signing the proposal.

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

BROOME COUNTY
DIVISION OF PURCHASING
PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

John Deere
Landscapes

*** You may bid a substitute – Specify which item is being bid.
(Substitutes may not necessarily be awarded)**

I. FUNGICIDES:

A.	Insignia	9.6 pound case	\$ <u>Size discontinued - No Bid</u>
B.	Insignia SC Intrinsic Brand (Agency)	4 x 30.5 oz. case	\$ <u>1,573.80/cs.</u>
*C.	Daconil Weatherstik <i>Manure 6 FL</i>	5 gallon case	\$ <u>137/cs.</u>
*D.	Chipco 26GT <i>18 Plus</i>	5 gallon case	\$ <u>210/cs.</u>
*E.	Banner Maxx <i>*Spectator Ultra</i>	2 gallon case	\$ <u>125/cs.</u>
	(Agency)	10 gallon link pack	\$ <u>2,060/LP</u>
F.	Curalan EG	33 pound keg	\$ <u>1,070/keg</u>
	or		
	Touche EG	33 pound keg	\$ <u> </u>
*G.	Cleary's 3336 F <i>Lesco T-Storm</i>	5 gallon case	\$ <u>300/cs.</u>
H.	Instrata (Agency)	5 gallon case	\$ <u>790/cs</u> <i>- if purchase of 5cs. or more per invoice, price is \$1675/cs!</i>
I.	Medallion 50 WP SC (Agency)	2 ^{gal} pound case	\$ <u>1,100/cs.</u>
*J.	Chipco Signature <i>Prodegg Signature</i>	22 pound case	\$ <u>628/cs - or - 1,111.00 / 44lb. cs of Chipco (Agency)</u>
K.	Emerald (Agency)	4.9 pound case	\$ <u>1,450.40/cs.</u>
L.	Segway	39.2 oz.	\$ <u>395/ea.</u>
*M.	Banol	1 gallon	\$ <u>465/gal.</u>
N.	Bayleton Flo (Agency)	5 gallon case	\$ <u>3000/cs.</u>
O.	Chipco Triton Flo	4 gallon case	\$ <u>Not Registered for use in NY! No Bid</u>
*P.	ProStar 70 WDG	12 pound case	\$ <u>680/cs.</u>

* Alternate / Equal - label enclosed

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

* *Q.	Torque <i>Tebuconazole 3.6%</i>	5 x 1 gallon case	\$ <u>320/cs.</u>
R.	Secure <i>(Agency)</i>	5 gallon case	\$ <u>2,825/cs.</u>
S.	Sync Fung Activator	12 x 16 oz. bottle case	\$ <u>NO BID</u>

II. **INSECTICIDES:**

* *A.	Merit 75 WSP <i>Bandit 75 WSP</i>	1.6 pound case	\$ <u>80/cs.</u>
*B.	Merit 75 WSP <i>(Agency)</i>	mega mini-drum	\$ <u>1,250/drum</u>
*C.	Sevin SL	5 gallon case	\$ <u>192/cs.</u>
* *D.	Scimitar GC <i>Cyonara 9.7EW lft.</i>	8 quart case	\$ <u>416/cs.</u>
E.	Acelepryn <i>(Agency)</i>	4 x 0.5 gallon case	\$ <u>3,710/cs.</u>

III. **HERBICIDES:**

*A.	Banvel	5 gallon case	\$ <u>NO BID</u>
B.	Speedzone Red	5 gallon case	\$ <u>390/cs.</u>
* *C.	Roundup Pro <i>Prosecutor Pro</i>	5 gallon case	\$ <u>96/cs.</u>
D.	Dimension 2EW	5 gallon case	\$ <u>940/cs.</u>
E.	Quick Silver	8 oz. bottle	\$ <u>125/btl.</u>
F.	Tupersan WP	48 lb. case	\$ <u>1,320/48lbs.</u>
G.	Lontrel	32 oz. bottle	\$ <u>148.50/qt.</u>
H.	SquareOne	8 oz. bottle .5lb.	\$ <u>68/.5lb.</u>
I.	Treflan G	40 pound bag	\$ <u>28/bag</u>
J.	Tenacity <i>(Agency)</i>	1 gallon	\$ <u>747/gal.</u>

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

* Alternate/Equal-labeled enclosed

PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

IV. PLANT GROWTH REGULATORS

*A.	Primo Maxx (Agency)	10 gallon link pack	\$ 2,740/LP
*B.	Primo Maxx T-Nex lag 16oz lqd.	2 gallon case	\$ 234.80/cs.
C.	Proxy	5 gallon case	\$ 190/cs.

V. GRASS SEED & FERTILIZER

*A.	3 Way Bentgrass Blend Pentrio Bentgrass 25lb/cu.	Price per pound	\$ 8.194/lb.
*B.	GLS Resistant Tri Rye Grass Noble Eagle Blend 50lbs/cu.	Price per pound	\$ 1.404/lb.
*C.	L-93 Creeping Bentgrass	Price per pound	\$ 11.80/lb.
D.	T-1 Bentgrass	Price per pound	\$ NO BID
E.	Alpha Bentgrass	Price per pound	\$ NO BID
*F.	Kentucky Bluegrass - LOW MOW Bluegrass Supreme, 50lb/cu.	Price per pound	\$ 2.87/lb.
G.	25-0-5 Lebanon 51% MESA 200 SGN or under	50 pound bag	\$ 19.25/bag
H.	30-0-0 Lebanon 100% MESA SGN 200 or under	50 pound bag	\$ 23.50/bag
*I.	16-4-8 Ammonium Sulfate, 1% Iron, 145 SGN 14-0-14E 97% AS. 9FE. 8MN 50lbs.	50 pound bag	\$ 24.75/bag
*J.	Rough Mix: (or similar blend) 30% Creeping Red Fescue; 25% Kentucky Bluegrass; 20% Chewings Fescue; 15% GLS Resistant Perennial Ryegrass; 10% Hard Fescue	Price per pound	\$ NO BID
K.	21-0-0 Ammorium Sulfate Mix	Per 50 pound bag	\$ 14.50/bag
*L.	0-0-50 Polyon Micro	Per 50 pound bag	\$ NO BID
M.	21-0-0 Ammorium Sulfate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ 14.50/bag
*N.	19-26-5 Starter Fertilizer 10-20-10 21-Poly Plus mop Starter 50lbs.	Per 50 pound bag	\$ 16.80/bag
O.	Potassium Nitrate (soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ NO BID

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

*Alternate/Equal - label enclosed

PROPOSAL SHEET

(Cont'd)

P.	Urea (soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>21/bag</u>
Q.	Iron Sulfate (soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>16/bag</u>
R.	Manganese Sulfate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>NO BID</u>
S.	Turf Screen	5 gallon case	\$ <u>↓</u>
T.	Calcium Nitrate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>↓</u>
U.	0-52-34 Mono-Potassium Phosphate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>↓</u>
V.	18-0-18 Andersons DG Pro SGN under 100	Per 40 pound bag	\$ <u>50/bag</u>

VI. **WETTING AGENT**

*	A.	Fleet <u>Lesco Wet Plus 25gal.</u>	5 gallon case	\$ <u>149/cs.</u>	
<u>MMV</u>	174	B.	Lesco Flo	5 gallon case	\$ <u>180/cs.</u>

The form of proposal as issued by the Purchasing Agent shall not be changed or added to by the bidder. It shall be completely filled in with black ink or typed. With respect to prices or other submissions filled in by the bidder in blank spaces, there shall be no erasures, cross-outs, correction fluid or the like unless initialed by the person signing the proposal.

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

BROOME COUNTY
 DIVISION OF PURCHASING
PROPOSAL SHEET
 (Cont'd)

Andre + Son

*** You may bid a substitute – Specify which item is being bid.
 (Substitutes may not necessarily be awarded)**

I. FUNGICIDES:

A.	Insignia	9.6 pound case	\$ <u>N/A</u>
B.	Insignia SC Intrinsic Brand	4 x 30.5 oz. case	\$ <u>1,573.80</u>
*C.	Daconil Weatherstik Chlorothalonil 720 (Qual:Pro)	5 gallon case	\$ <u>292.50</u> \$ 121.90
*D.	Chipco 26GT IPRO 25E (Qual:Pro)	5 gallon case	\$ <u>582.40</u> \$ 179.10
*E.	Banner Maxx Propiconazole 14.3% (Qual:Pro)	2 gallon case 5 gallon case 10 gallon link pack	\$ <u>428.00</u> 268.90 (2x2.5g) <u>2,060.00</u>
F.	Curalan EG OR Touche EG	33 pound keg 33 pound keg	\$ <u>925.⁰⁰</u> <u>N/A</u>
*G.	Cleary's 3336 F TM 4.5F (Qual:Pro)	5 gallon case	\$ <u>393.75</u> \$ 235.90
H.	Instrata	5 gallon case	\$ <u>790.00</u>
I.	Medallion 50 WP Medallion SC	2 pound case 1 gal case	\$ <u>592.00</u> \$ 550.00
*J.	Chipco Signature Fosety-A1 (Qual:Pro)	44 pound case 22 pound case	\$ <u>1,111.00</u> \$ 291.00
K.	Emerald Emerald	4.9 pound case 24.5 pound case	\$ <u>1,450.40</u> <u>6,247.50</u>
L.	Segway	39.2 oz.	\$ <u>395.00</u>
*M.	Banol ProPlant (Advan)	1 gallon	\$ <u>335.00</u> \$ 295.00
N.	Bayleton Flo	5 gallon case	\$ <u>3,000.00</u>
O.	Chipco Triton Flo	4 gallon case	\$ <u>N/A</u>
*P.	ProStar 70 WDG	12 pound case	\$ <u>653.00</u>

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

Andre & Son

PROPOSAL SHEET (Cont'd)

*Q.	Torque Tebuconazole 3.6F (Qual:Pro)	5 x 1 gallon case 4 x 1 gallon case	\$ <u>699.00</u> \$ <u>260.00</u>
R.	Secure	5 gallon case	\$ <u>2,825.00</u>
S.	Sync Fung Activator	12 x 16 oz. bottle case	\$ <u>N/A</u>

II. INSECTICIDES:

*A.	Merit 75 WSP Imidachloprid 75 WSP (Qual:Pro)	1.6 pound case	\$ <u>214.50</u> \$ <u>73.00</u>
*B.	Merit 75 WSP Imidachloprid 75 WSP (Qual:Pro)	mega mini-drum 3/8 x 1.6oz Drum	\$ <u>1,250.00</u> \$ <u>390.00</u>
*C.	Sevin SL	5 gallon case	\$ <u>161.00</u>
*D.	Scimitar GC Lambda Cy EC	8 quart case 8 quart case	\$ <u>981.00</u> \$ <u>449.40</u>
E.	Acelepryn	4 x 0.5 gallon case	\$ <u>3,710.00</u>

III. HERBICIDES:

*A.	Banvel	5 gallon case	\$ <u>455.00</u>
B.	Speedzone Red	5 gallon case	\$ <u>320.00</u>
*C.	Roundup Pro Cornerstone Plus	5 gallon case	\$ <u>96.00</u>
D.	Dimension 2EW	5 gallon case	\$ <u>910.00</u>
E.	Quick Silver	8 oz. bottle	\$ <u>110.00</u>
F.	Tupersan WP	48 lb. case	\$ <u>1,200.00</u>
G.	Lontrel	32 oz. bottle	\$ <u>151.00</u>
H.	SquareOne	8 oz. bottle	\$ <u>51.25</u>
I.	Treflan G	40 pound bag	\$ <u>24.25</u>
J.	Tenacity	1 gallon	\$ <u>747.00</u>

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

Andre + Son

IV. PLANT GROWTH REGULATORS

*A.	Primo Maxx	10 gallon link pack	\$ <u>2,740.00</u>
*B.	Primo Maxx T-NEK (Qual: Pro)	2 gallon case 2 gallon case	\$ <u>566.00</u> <u>215.00</u>
C.	Proxy Ethephon 25L	5 gallon case 5 gallon case	\$ <u>157.50</u> <u>120.00</u>

V. GRASS SEED & FERTILIZER

*A.	3 Way Bentgrass Blend	Price per pound	\$ <u>6.50</u>
*B.	GLS Resistant Tri Rye Grass	Price per pound	\$ <u>1.33</u>
*C.	L-93 Creeping Bentgrass	Price per pound	\$ <u>11.50</u>
D.	T-1 Bentgrass	Price per pound	\$ <u>13.50</u>
E.	Alpha Bentgrass	Price per pound	\$ <u>13.50</u>
F.	Kentucky Bluegrass - LOW MOW	Price per pound	\$ <u>2.98</u>
G.	25-0-5 Lebanon 51% MESA 200 SGN or under	50 pound bag	\$ <u>18.75</u>
H.	30-0-0 Lebanon 100% MESA SGN 200 or under	50 pound bag	\$ <u>23.00</u>
*I.	16-4-8 Ammonium Sulfate, 1% Iron, 145 SGN	50 pound bag	\$ <u>17.40</u>
*J.	Rough Mix: (or similar blend) 30% Creeping Red Fescue; 25% Kentucky Bluegrass; 20% Chewings Fescue; 15% GLS Resistant Perennial Ryegrass; 10% Hard Fescue	Price per pound	\$ <u>1.74</u>
K.	21-0-0 Ammorium Sulfate Mini	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>14.15</u>
*L.	0-0-50 Polyon Micro Duration 0-0-50 MICRO	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>48.80</u>
M.	21-0-0 Ammorium Sulfate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>14.40</u>
*N.	19-26-5 Starter Fertilizer	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>20.00</u>
O.	Potassium Nitrate (soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>39.00</u>

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

Andre + Son

PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

P.	Urea (soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>20.00</u>
Q.	Iron Sulfate (soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>18.50</u>
R.	Manganese Sulfate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>48.10</u>
S.	Turf Screen	5 gallon case	\$ <u>530.00</u>
T.	Calcium Nitrate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>23.95</u>
U.	0-52-34 Mono-Potassium Phosphate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>48.50</u>
V.	18-0-18 Andersons DG Pro SGN under 100	Per 40 pound bag	\$ <u>52.30</u>

VI. **WETTING AGENT**

A.	Fleet Cars by Aqua Aid	5 gallon case	\$ <u>395.00</u>
B.	Lesco Flo AQUAC by Aqua Aid	5 gallon case	\$ <u>240.00</u>

The form of proposal as issued by the Purchasing Agent shall not be changed or added to by the bidder. It shall be completely filled in with black ink or typed. With respect to prices or other submissions filled in by the bidder in blank spaces, there shall be no erasures, cross-outs, correction fluid or the like unless initialed by the person signing the proposal.

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

BROOME COUNTY
 DIVISION OF PURCHASING
PROPOSAL SHEET
 (Cont'd)

Pennington
 Seed

*** You may bid a substitute – Specify which item is being bid.
 (Substitutes may not necessarily be awarded)**

I. FUNGICIDES:

A.	Insignia	9.6 pound case	\$ <u> </u>
B.	Insignia SC Intrinsic Brand	4 x 30.5 oz. case	\$ <u> </u>
*C.	Daconil Weatherstik Chlorothalonil 720 SFT	5 gallon case 2 x 2.5g	\$ <u>7250/25 gal</u>
*D.	Chipco 26GT	5 gallon case	\$ <u> </u>
*E.	Banner Maxx Propiconazole 2+1g 2 x 2.25g	2 gallon case 10 gallon link pack	\$ <u>6750/gallon</u> \$ <u> </u>
F.	Curalan EG	33 pound keg	\$ <u> </u>
	or Touche EG	33 pound keg	\$ <u> </u>
*G.	Cleary's 3336 F TM45F10W 2 x 2.5g	5 gallon case	\$ <u>146.00/gallon</u>
H.	Instrata	5 gallon case	\$ <u> </u>
I.	Medallion 50 WP	2 pound case	\$ <u> </u>
*J.	Chipco Signature	22 pound case	\$ <u> </u>
K.	Emerald	4.9 pound case	\$ <u> </u>
L.	Segway	39.2 oz.	\$ <u> </u>
*M.	Banol	1 gallon	\$ <u> </u>
N.	Bayleton Flo	5 gallon case	\$ <u> </u>
O.	Chipco Triton Flo	4 gallon case	\$ <u> </u>
*P.	ProStar 70 WDG	12 pound case	\$ <u> </u>

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

*Q.	Torque	5 x 1 gallon case	\$ <u> — </u>
R.	Secure	5 gallon case	\$ <u> — </u>
S.	Sync Fung Activator	12 x 16 oz. bottle case	\$ <u> — </u>
II. INSECTICIDES:			
*A.	Merit 75 WSP	4-1.6oz CS 1.6 pound case	\$ <u>22.50 / 1.6oz pack</u>
		<i>Imidacloprid WSB</i>	
*B.	Merit 75 WSP	mega mini-drum	\$ <u> — </u>
*C.	Sevin SL	5 gallon case	\$ <u> — </u>
*D.	Scimitar GC	8 quart case	\$ <u> — </u>
E.	Acelepryn	4 x 0.5 gallon case	\$ <u> — </u>
III. HERBICIDES:			
*A.	Banvel	5 gallon case	\$ <u> — </u>
B.	Speedzone Red	5 gallon case	\$ <u> — </u>
*C.	Roundup Pro	Eraser glyphosate 2x2.5g 5 gallon case	\$ <u>44.12 / 2.5g</u>
D.	Dimension 2EW	5 gallon case	\$ <u> — </u>
E.	Quick Silver	8 oz. bottle	\$ <u> — </u>
F.	Tupersan WP	48 lb. case	\$ <u> — </u>
G.	Lontrel	32 oz. bottle	\$ <u> — </u>
H.	SquareOne	8 oz. bottle	\$ <u> — </u>
I.	Treflan G	50-40# pallet 40 pound bag	\$ <u>24.10 / bag</u>
J.	Tenacity	1 gallon	\$ <u> — </u>

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

*Pennington
Seed*

IV. PLANT GROWTH REGULATORS

*A.	Primo Maxx	10 gallon link pack	\$ <u> -</u>
*B.	Primo Maxx	2 gallon case	\$ <u> -</u>
C.	Proxy	5 gallon case	\$ <u> -</u>

V. GRASS SEED & FERTILIZER

*A.	3 Way Bentgrass Blend	Price per pound	\$ <u> -</u>
*B.	GLS Resistant Tri Rye Grass	Price per pound	\$ <u> 1.40/# </u>
*C.	<i>Professional Select GLSR</i> L-93 Creeping Bentgrass	Price per pound	\$ <u> -</u>
D.	T-1 Bentgrass	Price per pound	\$ <u> -</u>
E.	Alpha Bentgrass	Price per pound	\$ <u> -</u>
F.	Kentucky Bluegrass - LOW MOW	Price per pound	\$ <u> 2.20/# </u>
G.	<i>Triplex Bluegrass</i> 25-0-5 Lebanon 51% MESA 200 SGN or under	50 pound bag	\$ <u> -</u>
H.	30-0-0 Lebanon 100% MESA SGN 200 or under	50 pound bag	\$ <u> -</u>
*I.	16-4-8 Ammonium Sulfate, 1% Iron, 145 SGN	50 pound bag	\$ <u> -</u>
*J.	Rough Mix: (or similar blend) 30% Creeping Red Fescue; 25% Kentucky Bluegrass; 20% Chewings Fescue; 15% GLS Resistant Perennial Ryegrass; 10% Hard Fescue	Price per pound	\$ <u> 1.59/# </u>
K.	21-0-0 Ammorium Sulfate Mini	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u> -</u>
*L.	0-0-50 Polyon Micro	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u> -</u>
M.	21-0-0 Ammorium Sulfate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u> -</u>
*N.	19-26-5 Starter Fertilizer	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u> 22.80 / bag </u>
O.	<i>Penn 18-24-6 25% Slow Release</i> Potassium Nitrate (soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u> -</u>

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

*Pennington
Seed*

P.	Urea (soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u> </u>
Q.	Iron Sulfate (soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u> </u>
R.	Manganese Sulfate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u> </u>
S.	Turf Screen	5 gallon case	\$ <u> </u>
T.	Calcium Nitrate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u> </u>
U.	0-52-34 Mono-Potassium Phosphate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u> </u>
V.	18-0-18 Andersons DG Pro SGN under 100	Per 40 pound bag	\$ <u> </u>

VI. **WETTING AGENT**

A.	Fleet	5 gallon case	\$ <u> </u>
B.	Lesco Flo	5 gallon case	\$ <u> </u>

The form of proposal as issued by the Purchasing Agent shall not be changed or added to by the bidder. It shall be completely filled in with black ink or typed. With respect to prices or other submissions filled in by the bidder in blank spaces, there shall be no erasures, cross-outs, correction fluid or the like unless initialed by the person signing the proposal.

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

BROOME COUNTY
 DIVISION OF PURCHASING
 PROPOSAL SHEET
 (Cont'd)

*Crop Production
 Service*

*** You may bid a substitute – Specify which item is being bid.
 (Substitutes may not necessarily be awarded)**

I. FUNGICIDES:

A.	Insignia	9.6 pound case	\$ <u>NOT AVAILABLE</u>
B.	Insignia SC Intrinsic Brand	4 x 30.5 oz. case	\$ <u>1573.80</u>
*C.	Daconil Weatherstik ENSIGN 720	5 gallon case	\$ <u>150.00</u>
*D.	Chipco 26GT CHIPCO 26019	5 gallon case	\$ <u>199.95</u>
*E.	Banner Maxx PROCONZ	2 gallon case	\$ <u>126.50</u>
		10 gallon link pack	\$ <u>632.50</u>
F.	Curalan EG	33 pound keg	\$ <u>921.00</u>
	or		
	Touche EG	33 pound keg	\$ <u>NO BID</u>
*G.	Cleary's 3336 F T-METHYL	5 gallon case	\$ <u>232.75</u>
H.	Instrata	5 gallon case	\$ <u>790.00</u>
	INSTRATA (OVER 25 GALLON PURCHASE)		\$ <u>675.00</u>
I.	Medallion 50 WP	2 pound case	\$ <u>527.00</u>
*J.	Chipco Signature	22 pound case	\$ <u>495.00</u>
K.	Emerald	4.9 pound case	\$ <u>1450.40</u>
L.	Segway	39.2 oz.	\$ <u>395.00</u>
*M.	Banol PROPANT	1 gallon	\$ <u>325.00</u>
N.	Bayleton Flo	5 gallon case	\$ <u>3000.00</u>
O.	Chipco Triton Flo	4 gallon case	\$ <u>NOT REGISTERED</u>
*P.	ProStar 70 WDG	12 pound case	\$ <u>642.40</u>

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

Crop Production Service

PROPOSAL SHEET (Cont'd)

*Q.	Torque TEBUCONAZOLE 3.6F T ₁₀	5 x 1 gallon case	\$ <u>312.50</u>
R.	Secure	5 gallon case	\$ <u>2825.00</u>
S.	Sync Fung Activator LT-700	12 x 16 oz. bottle case 1 GALLON	\$ <u>32.00</u> \$
II. INSECTICIDES:			
*A.	Merit 75 WSP MALICE 75 WSB	1.6 pound case	\$ <u>72.50</u>
*B.	Merit 75 WSP MALICE 75 WSB	mega mini-drum 48 x 1.6 oz DRUM	\$ <u>217.50</u>
*C.	Sevin SL CARBARYL 4L	5 gallon case	\$ <u>162.50</u>
*D.	Scimitar GC	8 quart case	\$ <u>1090.00</u>
E.	Acelepryn	4 x 0.5 gallon case	\$ <u>3710.00</u>
III. HERBICIDES:			
*A.	Banvel RIFLE	5 gallon case	\$ <u>355.00</u>
B.	Speedzone Red	5 gallon case	\$ <u>335.00</u>
*C.	Roundup Pro KLEEN UP PRO	5 gallon case	\$ <u>85.00</u>
D.	Dimension 2EW	5 gallon case	\$ <u>910.00</u>
E.	Quick Silver	8 oz. bottle	\$ <u>106.69</u>
F.	Tupersan WP	48 lb. case	\$ <u>1295.00</u>
G.	Lontrel	32 oz. bottle	\$ <u>148.50</u>
H.	SquareOne	8 oz. bottle	\$ <u>45.00</u>
I.	Treflan G	40 pound bag	\$ <u>27.50</u>
J.	Tenacity	1 gallon	\$ <u>747.00</u>

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

*Crop Production
Service*

IV. PLANT GROWTH REGULATORS

*A.	Primo Maxx GAME - up	10 gallon link pack	\$ <u>1280.00</u>
*B.	Primo Maxx GAME -up	2 gallon case	\$ <u>265.00</u>
C.	Proxy	5 gallon case	\$ <u>134.95</u>

V. GRASS SEED & FERTILIZER

*A.	3 Way Bentgrass Blend	Price per pound	\$ <u>5.19</u>
*B.	GLS Resistant Tri Rye Grass	Price per pound	\$ <u>1.43</u>
*C.	L-93 Creeping Bentgrass 007 CREEPING BENT	Price per pound	\$ <u>9.95</u>
D.	T-1 Bentgrass TYEE CREEPING BENT	Price per pound	\$ <u>10.75</u>
E.	Alpha Bentgrass	Price per pound	\$ <u>NO BID</u>
F.	Kentucky Bluegrass - LOW MOW	Price per pound	\$ <u>1.95</u>
G.	25-0-5 Lebanon 51% MESA 200 SGN or under 24-0-5 50% xcu + 5% fe	50 pound bag	\$ <u>18.79</u>
H.	30-0-0 Lebanon 100% MESA SGN 200 or under 46-0-0 100% STAY N	50 pound bag	\$ <u>19.95</u>
*I.	16-4-8 Ammonium Sulfate, 1% Iron, 145 SGN 16-0-8 AM. SULFATE SGN 95	50 pound bag	\$ <u>21.95</u>
*J.	Rough Mix: (or similar blend) 30% Creeping Red Fescue; 25% Kentucky Bluegrass; 20% Chewings Fescue; 15% GLS Resistant Perennial Ryegrass; 10% Hard Fescue PREMIUM LANDSCAPE BLEND	Price per pound	\$ <u>1.51</u>
K.	21-0-0 Ammorium Sulfate Mini	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>NO BID</u>
*L.	0-0-50 Polyon Micro DURATION 0-0-50	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>49.95</u>
M.	21-0-0 Ammorium Sulfate (Soluble) ACTA MASTER 21-0-0	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>14.50</u>
*N.	19-26-5 Starter Fertilizer	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>NO BID</u>
O.	Potassium Nitrate (soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>NO BID</u>

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

P.	Urea (soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>16.50</u>
Q.	Iron Sulfate (soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>18.00</u>
R.	Manganese Sulfate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>NO Bid</u>
S.	Turf Screen SARGE	5 gallon case	\$ <u>350.00</u>
T.	Calcium Nitrate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>NO Bid</u>
U.	0-52-34 Mono-Potassium Phosphate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>NO Bid</u>
V.	18-0-18 Andersons DG Pro SGN under 100 SIGNATURE 18-0-19 SGN 95	Per 40 pound bag 50 lb BAG	\$ <u>44.50</u>
VI.	WETTING AGENT		
A.	Fleet NEPTUNE	5 gallon case	\$ <u>375.00</u>
B.	Lesco Flo RESPOND 3	5 gallon case	\$ <u>189.75</u>

The form of proposal as issued by the Purchasing Agent shall not be changed or added to by the bidder. It shall be completely filled in with black ink or typed. With respect to prices or other submissions filled in by the bidder in blank spaces, there shall be no erasures, cross-outs, correction fluid or the like unless initialed by the person signing the proposal.

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

BROOME COUNTY
DIVISION OF PURCHASING
PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

Northeast
Pro Turf

*** You may bid a substitute – Specify which item is being bid.
(Substitutes may not necessarily be awarded)**

I. FUNGICIDES:

A.	Insignia	9.6 pound case	\$ _____
B.	Insignia SC Intrinsic Brand	4 x 30.5 oz. case	\$ <u>1,573.80</u>
*C.	Daconil Weatherstik	5 gallon case	\$ <u>292.50</u>
*D.	Chipco 26GT	5 gallon case	\$ <u>890.00</u>
*E.	Banner Maxx	2 gallon case	\$ <u>428.00</u>
		10 gallon link pack	\$ <u>2,060.00</u>
F.	Curalan EG	33 pound keg	\$ <u>1,196.25</u>
	OR		
	Touche EG	33 pound keg	\$ _____
*G.	Cleary's 3336 F	5 gallon case	\$ <u>540.00</u>
H.	Instrata	5 gallon case	\$ <u>790.00</u>
I.	Medallion 50 WP	2 pound case	\$ <u>1,075.00</u>
*J.	Chipco Signature	22 pound case	\$ <u>550.00</u>
K.	Emerald	4.9 pound case	\$ <u>1,450.40</u>
L.	Segway	39.2 oz.	\$ <u>525.00</u>
*M.	Banol	1 gallon	\$ <u>370.00</u>
N.	Bayleton Flo	5 gallon case	\$ <u>3,000.00</u>
O.	Chipco Triton Flo	4 gallon case	\$ <u>960.00</u>
*P.	ProStar 70 WDG	12 pound case	\$ <u>1,050.00</u>

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

Northeast
Pro Turf

PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

*Q.	Torque	5 x 1 gallon case	\$ <u>1,111.00</u>
R.	Secure	5 gallon case	\$ <u>2,825.00</u>
S.	Sync Fung Activator	12 x 16 oz. bottle case	\$ <u>449.25</u>

II. INSECTICIDES:

*A.	Merit 75 WSP	1.6 pound case	\$ _____
*B.	Merit 75 WSP	mega mini-drum	\$ <u>1,250.00</u>
*C.	Sevin SL	5 gallon case	\$ <u>325.00</u>
*D.	Scimitar GC	8 quart case	\$ <u>1,268.80</u>
E.	Acelepryn	4 x 0.5 gallon case	\$ <u>3,710.00</u>

III. HERBICIDES:

*A.	Banvel	5 gallon case	\$ _____
B.	Speedzone Red	5 gallon case	\$ <u>419.75</u>
*C.	Roundup Pro	5 gallon case	\$ _____
D.	Dimension 2EW	5 gallon case	\$ <u>1,111.00</u>
E.	Quick Silver	8 oz. bottle	\$ <u>150.00</u>
F.	Tupersan WP	48 lb. case	\$ <u>1,850.00</u>
G.	Lontrel	32 oz. bottle	\$ <u>448.75</u>
H.	SquareOne	8 oz. bottle	\$ <u>100.00</u>
I.	Treflan G	40 pound bag	\$ _____
J.	Tenacity	1 gallon	\$ <u>747.00</u>

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

BROOME COUNTY
 DIVISION OF PURCHASING
PROPOSAL SHEET
 (Cont'd)

Winfield
 Solutions

*** You may bid a substitute – Specify which item is being bid.
 (Substitutes may not necessarily be awarded)**

I. FUNGICIDES:

A.	Insignia	9.6 pound case	\$ <u>NO Bid</u>
B.	Insignia SC Intrinsic Brand	4 x 30.5 oz. case	\$ <u>1,573⁸⁰</u>
*C.	Daconil Weatherstik	5 gallon case	\$ <u>292⁵⁰</u>
*D.	Chipco 26GT	5 gallon case	\$ <u>588.²⁰</u>
*E.	Banner Maxx	2 gallon case	\$ <u>428⁰⁰</u>
		10 gallon link pack	\$ <u>2,060⁰⁰</u>
F.	Curalan EG	33 pound keg	\$ <u>989.⁰¹</u>
	or		
	Touche EG	33 pound keg	\$ <u> </u>
*G.	Cleary's 3336 F	5 gallon case	\$ <u>430.¹⁵</u>
H.	Instrata	5 gallon case	\$ <u>790⁰⁰</u>
I.	Medallion 50 WP	2 pound case	\$ <u>592⁰⁰</u>
*J.	Chipco Signature	22 pound case	\$ <u>602.³⁶</u>
K.	Emerald	4.9 pound case	\$ <u>1,450.⁴⁰</u>
L.	Segway	39.2 oz.	\$ <u>375⁰⁰</u>
*M.	Banol	1 gallon	\$ <u>424.⁵³</u>
N.	Bayleton Flo	5 gallon case	\$ <u>3,000⁰⁰</u>
O.	Chipco Triton Flo	4 gallon case	\$ <u>NO Bid NOT Registered in NY</u>
*P.	ProStar 70 WDG	12 pound case	\$ <u>627.⁸⁴</u>

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

Sub.
NUFAM
TClovenazole

*Q.	Torque	5 x 1 gallon case	\$ <u>333.³⁵</u>
R.	Secure	5 gallon case	\$ <u>2825.⁰⁰</u>
S.	Sync Fung Activator	12 x 16 oz. bottle case	\$ <u>191.⁰⁴</u>

II. INSECTICIDES:

*A.	Merit 75 WSP	1.6 pound case	\$ <u>216.⁸³</u>
*B.	Merit 75 WSP	mega mini-drum	\$ <u>1,250.⁰⁰</u>
*C.	Sevin SL	5 gallon case	\$ <u>175.⁰⁵</u>
*D.	Scimitar GC	8 quart case	\$ <u>1008.⁰⁸</u>
E.	Acelepryn	4 x 0.5 gallon case	\$ <u>3,710.⁰⁰</u>

III. HERBICIDES:

*A.	Banvel	5 gallon case	\$ <u>NO BID</u>
B.	Speedzone Red	5 gallon case	\$ <u>328.⁴⁵</u>
*C.	Roundup Pro	5 gallon case	\$ <u>103.⁴⁰</u>
D.	Dimension 2EW	5 gallon case	\$ <u>902.⁵⁰</u>
E.	Quick Silver	8 oz. bottle	\$ <u>109.⁵⁰</u>
F.	Tupersan WP	48 lb. case	\$ <u>1203.⁸⁴</u>
G.	Lontrel	32 oz. bottle	\$ <u>148.⁷⁶</u>
H.	SquareOne	8 oz. bottle	\$ <u>50.⁸⁰</u>
I.	Treflan G	40 pound bag	\$ <u>25.²⁰</u>
J.	Tenacity	1 gallon	\$ <u>747.⁰⁰</u>

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

*Winfield
Solutions*

IV. PLANT GROWTH REGULATORS

*A.	Primo Maxx	10 gallon link pack	\$ <u>2,740⁰⁰</u>
*B.	Primo Maxx	2 gallon case	\$ <u>566⁰⁰</u>
C.	Proxy	5 gallon case	\$ <u>200.³⁰</u>

V. GRASS SEED & FERTILIZER

*A.	3 Way Bentgrass Blend	Price per pound	\$ <u>NO Bid</u>
*B.	GLS Resistant Tri Rye Grass	Price per pound	\$ <u>1.59</u>
*C.	L-93 Creeping Bentgrass	Price per pound	\$ <u>10.¹¹</u>
D.	T-1 Bentgrass	Price per pound	\$ <u>10.²⁸</u>
E.	Alpha Bentgrass	Price per pound	\$ <u>NO Bid</u>
F.	Kentucky Bluegrass – LOW MOW	Price per pound	\$ <u>3.⁰⁰</u>
G.	25-0-5 Lebanon 51% MESA 200 SGN or under	50 pound bag	\$ <u>NO Bid</u>
H.	30-0-0 Lebanon 100% MESA SGN 200 or under	50 pound bag	\$ <u>NO Bid</u>
*I.	16-4-8 Ammonium Sulfate, 1% Iron, 145 SGN	50 pound bag	\$ <u>NO Bid</u>
*J.	Rough Mix: (or similar blend) 30% Creeping Red Fescue; 25% Kentucky Bluegrass; 20% Chewings Fescue; 15% GLS Resistant Perennial Ryegrass; 10% Hard Fescue	Price per pound	\$ <u>2.⁰⁵</u>
K.	21-0-0 Ammorium Sulfate Mini	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>18.⁰³</u>
*L.	0-0-50 Polyon Micro	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>NO Bid</u>
M.	21-0-0 Ammorium Sulfate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>18.⁰³</u>
*N.	19-26-5 Starter Fertilizer	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>30.⁸²</u>
O.	Potassium Nitrate (soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>NO Bid</u>

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.

PROPOSAL SHEET
(Cont'd)

P.	Urea (soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>18.¹²</u>
Q.	Iron Sulfate (soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>NO Bid</u>
R.	Manganese Sulfate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>NO Bid</u>
S.	Turf Screen	5 gallon case	\$ <u>NO Bid</u>
T.	Calcium Nitrate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>NO Bid</u>
U.	0-52-34 Mono-Potassium Phosphate (Soluble)	Per 50 pound bag	\$ <u>NO Bid</u>
V.	18-0-18 Andersons DG Pro SGN under 100	Per 40 pound bag	\$ <u>52.³⁰</u>

VI. **WETTING AGENT**

A.	Fleet	5 gallon case	\$ <u>NO Bid</u>
B.	Lesco Flo	5 gallon case	\$ <u>NO Bid</u>

The form of proposal as issued by the Purchasing Agent shall not be changed or added to by the bidder. It shall be completely filled in with black ink or typed. With respect to prices or other submissions filled in by the bidder in blank spaces, there shall be no erasures, cross-outs, correction fluid or the like unless initialed by the person signing the proposal.

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET WITH THE PROPOSAL.