



BID TITLE: PURCHASE OF COPIER, FINE AND OTHER PAPERS REBID
BID NUMBER: RFB - 2015 - 005
BID OPENING: February 4, 2015
DEPARTMENT: INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY

 BIDDERS NAME:	Veritiv	Edge Document Solutions	WB Mason	AFP Industries
Proposal Signed & Duplicated?	OK	NO BID	OK	OK
Non-Collusive Bidding Certificate Signed?	OK		OK	OK
Variation and Justification Sheet Included?				
Insurance Acknowledgement Signed?	OK		OK	OK
Election Law Statement Completed & Signed?	OK		OK	OK
Gift Statement Completed & Signed?	No		OK	OK
Bidders Checklist Completed & Signed?	OK		OK	OK
W-9 Completed & Signed?	OK		OK	OK
Addendum(s) No. _____, _____, _____,	NA	↓	NA	NA

BID TITLE: PURCHASE OF COPIER, FINE AND OTHER PAPERS REBID
BID NUMBER: RFB - 2015 - 005
BID OPENING: February 4, 2015
DEPARTMENT: INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY

BIDDERS NAME: 	Contract Paper Group			
Proposal Signed & Duplicated?	OK			
Non-Collusive Bidding Certificate Signed?	OK			
Variation and Justification Sheet Included?				
Insurance Acknowledgement Signed?	OK			
Election Law Statement Completed & Signed?	OK			
Gift Statement Completed & Signed?	OK			
Bidders Checklist Completed & Signed?	OK			
W-9 Completed & Signed?	OK			
Addendum(s) No. _____, _____, _____,	NA			

VENDOR NAME: VERITIV

PROPOSAL SHEET

(PRICE PER M times Estimated & Actual Quantities = Total Price)

Six (6) Months
Estimated & Actual
Quantities Combined

Total Price

Item	Description	Price Per/M Sheets	Quantities Combined	Total Price
1)	8 1/2" X 11", 20# Virgin Premium #4 Copier Paper	\$ <u>6.33</u> /M Sheets Per Case: <u>5000</u> = Case Price: \$ <u>31.65</u>	600 M 600,000 sheets	\$ <u>3,798.00</u>
	Brand Proposed <u>VECTOR</u>	Manufacturer <u>IP</u>	Manufacturers Item/Stock # <u>095348</u>	
2)	8 1/2" X 14" - 20# Virgin Premium #4 Copier Paper	\$ <u>9.18</u> /M Sheets Per Case: <u>5000</u> = Case Price: \$ <u>45.90</u>	150 M 150,000 sheets	\$ <u>1,377.00</u>
	Brand Proposed <u>VECTOR</u>	Manufacturer <u>IP</u>	Manufacturers Item/Stock # <u>095346</u>	
3)	11" X 17" - 20 # Virgin Premium #4 Copier Copier Paper	\$ <u>14.43</u> /M Sheets Per Case: <u>2500</u> = Case Price: \$ <u>36.08</u>	50 M 50,000 sheets	\$ <u>721.50</u>
	Brand Proposed <u>VECTOR</u>	Manufacturer <u>IP</u>	Manufacturers Item/Stock # <u>095349</u>	

VENDOR NAME: AFP INDUSTRIES

SEE BID
PROPOSAL SHEET

(PRICE PER M times Estimated & Actual Quantities = Total Price)

Six (6) Months
Estimated & Actual
Quantities Combined

Total Price

Item	Description	Price Per/M Sheets	Quantities Combined	Total Price
1)	8 1/2" X 11", 20# <u>NO BID</u> Virgin Premium #4 Copier Paper	\$ _____ /M Sheets Per Case: _____ = Case Price: \$ _____	600 M 600,000 sheets	\$ <u>NA</u>
	Brand Proposed _____	Manufacturer _____	Manufacturers Item/Stock # _____	
2)	8 1/2" X 14" - 20# <u>NO BID</u> Virgin Premium #4 Copier Paper	\$ _____ /M Sheets Per Case: _____ = Case Price: \$ _____	150 M 150,000 sheets	\$ <u>NA</u>
	Brand Proposed _____	Manufacturer _____	Manufacturers Item/Stock # _____	
3)	11" X 17" - 20 # <u>NO BID</u> Virgin Premium #4 Copier Copier Paper	\$ _____ /M Sheets Per Case: _____ = Case Price: \$ _____	50 M 50,000 sheets	\$ <u>NA</u>
	Brand Proposed _____	Manufacturer _____	Manufacturers Item/Stock # _____	

VENDOR NAME: WB MASON

PROPOSAL SHEET

(PRICE PER M times Estimated & Actual Quantities = Total Price)

Six (6) Months
Estimated & Actual
Quantities Combined

Total Price

Item	Description	Price Per/M Sheets	Quantities Combined	Total Price
1)	8 1/2" X 11", 20# Virgin Premium #4 Copier Paper	\$ <u>4.95</u> /M Sheets Per Case: <u>5000</u> = Case Price: \$ <u>24.75</u>	600 M 600,000 sheets	\$ <u>2,970.00</u>
	Brand Proposed <u>MASON FLAGSHIP</u>	Manufacturer <u>BOISE CASCADE</u>	Manufacturers Item/Stock # <u>WBM 21200</u>	
2)	8 1/2" X 14" - 20# Virgin Premium #4 Copier Paper	\$ <u>7.24</u> /M Sheets Per Case: <u>5000</u> = Case Price: \$ <u>36.20</u>	150 M 150,000 sheets	\$ <u>1,086.00</u>
	Brand Proposed <u>MASON FLAGSHIP</u>	Manufacturer <u>BOISE CASCADE</u>	Manufacturers Item/Stock # <u>WBM 24200</u>	
3)	11" X 17" - 20 # Virgin Premium #4 Copier Copier Paper	\$ <u>11.32</u> /M Sheets Per Case: <u>2500</u> = Case Price: \$ <u>28.30</u>	50 M 50,000 sheets	\$ <u>566.00</u>
	Brand Proposed <u>MASON FLAGSHIP</u>	Manufacturer <u>BOISE CASCADE</u>	Manufacturers Item/Stock # <u>WBM 28110</u>	

VENDOR NAME: CONTRACT PAPER GROUP

PROPOSAL SHEET

(PRICE PER M times Estimated & Actual Quantities = Total Price)

Six (6) Months
Estimated & Actual
Quantities Combined

Total Price

Item	Description	Price Per/M Sheets	Quantities Combined	Total Price
1)	8 1/2" X 11", 20# Virgin Premium #4 Copier Paper	\$ <u>4.948</u> /M Sheets Per Case: <u>5000</u> = Case Price: \$ <u>24.74</u>	600 M 600,000 sheets	\$ <u>2,968.80</u>
	Brand Proposed <u>MP XEROGRAPHIC</u>	Manufacturer <u>INDAHKAT</u>	Manufacturers Item/Stock # <u>PB7FWH 11</u>	
2)	8 1/2" X 14" - 20# Virgin Premium #4 Copier Paper	\$ <u>7.28</u> /M Sheets Per Case: <u>5000</u> = Case Price: \$ <u>36.40</u>	150 M 150,000 sheets	\$ <u>1,092.00</u>
	Brand Proposed <u>LG COPY</u>	Manufacturer <u>AP+P</u>	Manufacturers Item/Stock # <u>075-LG14</u>	
3)	11" X 17" - 20 # Virgin Premium #4 Copier Copier Paper	\$ <u>13.48</u> /M Sheets Per Case: <u>2500</u> = Case Price: \$ <u>33.70</u>	50 M 50,000 sheets	\$ <u>674.00</u>
	Brand Proposed <u>AMERICAN EAGLE</u>	Manufacturer <u>AMERICAN EAGLE</u>	Manufacturers Item/Stock # <u>A44-31600503</u>	