Broome County Division of Purchasing
Debra A. Preston, County Executive . John A. Flynn, Jr, Director of Purchasing

NOTICE OF BID AWARD

December 28, 2016

Whom It May Concern:

This shall advise you that on December 28, 2016, the Board of Acquisition and Contract accepted the bids of
December 14, 2016 for furnishing the following to Broome County:

BID TITLE:  Purchase of Plow Blades/ Shoes & Salt Spreader Chains

BID #: 2016-101
CA# 11-2310
TERM: 12/15/2016 — 04/30/2017

AMOUNT: See Attached

Purchase order(s) will be forthcoming upon receipt of a certificate of insurance in compliance with the insurance
requirements as stated in the specifications. Incorrect insurance certificates will cause delays in payment.

If you have not submitted the proper insurance certificate, please send a copy to Thomas Dellapenna, Risk
Manager, Broome County Office of Risk Management, County Office Building, 3rd Floor, 60 Hawley Street,
P.O. Box 1766, Binghamton, NY 13902-1766. Phone: (607) 778-2402 Fax #: (607) 778-6009

IMPORTANT: Please include the bid title and bid number on the insurance certificate.

Very truly yours,

s

John A. Flynn, Jr.
Director

cc: Patrick Latting - DPW Highway
Purchasing - Bid File
Jeanne Bourque - Risk

Broome County Office Building . 60 Hawley Street . PO.Box 1766 . Binghamton, New York 13902
Phone: (607) 778-2188 . Fax:(607) 778-2346 . www.gobroomecounty.com




Awarded Vendors
Plow Blades/ Shoes & Salt Spreader Chains

Chemung Supply

PO Box 527

Elmira, NY 14902

Phone: 607-733-5506

Fax: 607-732-5379

800 #: 800-733-5508

E-mail: cperine@chemungsupply.com

Expanded Supply Products
3330 Route 9

Cold Spring, NY 10516
Phone: 845-265-3771

Fax: 845-265-3772

E-mail: B.Kehr@hotmail.com

Steel Sales

8085 State Highway 12
Sherburne, NY 13460

Phone: 607-674-6363

Fax: 607-674-9706

800 #: 800-238-7833

Email: Pat@steelsalesinc.com

Valley Blades Limited

435 Phillip Street

Waterloo, Ontario, Canada

Phone: 519-885-5500

Fax: 519-746-2780

800 #: 800-461-1824

E-mail: cdienesch@valleyblades.com

Winter Equipment

1900 Joseph Lloyd Pkwy
Willoughby, OH 44094

Phone: 800-294-6837

Fax: 888-810-9363

E-mail: bids@winterequipment.com
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RFB-2016-101
Plow Blades/ Shoes Salt Spreader Chains

Item # Description Chemung Supply Steel Sales Winter Equipment Expanded Supply Products Valley Blades Limited
Item #1 Awarded Ist Low 2nd Low 3rd Low 4th Low Not Awarded This Item
Steel Snow Plow Blade Edges: 17 x 8” x 5 Surface|  gquivalent Manufacturer: Evolution Edges Black Cat Valk Valley Blades Limited
hardened or flame hardened
. 5/9
! Only— 7 hole — reversible - punched for 75 plow Part # EPBTPSCA-20901 PBB8806049 ESP185 1860WVFSE
bolts on 3” — 3” — 12” centers
~ Pacal #P§849501 or equal Unit / Each Price: $95.55 $111.00 $114.46* $130.68 $150.00
Item #2 Awarded 1st Low 2nd Low 3rd Low 4th Low Not Awarded This Item
Steel Snow Plow Blade Edges: 17 x 87 x 6" Surface|  Equjvalent Manufacturer: Evolution Edges Black Cat Valk -
hardened or flame hardened Valley Blades Limited
2 Only — 8 hole — reversible — punched for 8" plow Part # PBB8807249
bolts on 3” — 3” — 12” centers EPBTPSCA-20902 ESP186 1872WVFSE
— Pacal #P8849601 or equal B .
Unit / Bach Price: $114.66 $133.00 $137.35% $157.64 $180.00
Item #3 Awarded 4th Low 2nd Low (Tie) Not Awarded This Item 1st Low 2nd Low (Tie)
Carbide Insert Blade: ¥4” x 6” x 4’ -6 hole — Manufacturer: Evolution Edges Winter Equipment Valk Valley Blades Limited
3 punched for 8" plow bolts on 3" 3" — 12” Part #: ECBTPSQA-21480 CB3041522 ESP3/464 34648WPTSB
centers Unit / Each Price: $173.56 $170.00 $179.07 $163.64 $170.00
Item #4 Awarded 4th Low 2nd Low (Tie) Not Awarded This Item 1st Low 2nd Low (Tie)
Carbide Insert Blade: ¥4” x 6” x 3° -5 hole - Manufacturer: Evolution Edges Winter Equipment Valk Valley Blades Limited
4 punched for 75’ plow bolts on 3" — 3" — 12” Part #: ECBTPSQA-21360 CB3031522 ESP3/463 34636WPTSB
centers Unit / Each Price: $130.17 $127.50 $238.76 $122.73 $127.50
Item #5 Awarded 3rd Low 2nd Low 1st Low 4th Low
(Price Per Foot)
Spreader Chains: pintle link: 667X, bar flight: Widths:
5 %8 x 1 4", bar flight location: every other link, a. 20 ¥2” center to center: $25.50 $24.50 NO BID $23.75 $28.00
bar flight to be double welded at each end b. 217 center to center: $25.50 $24.50 NO BID $23.75 $28.00
c. 21 1/16” center to center: $25.50 $24.50 NO BID $23.75 $28.00
d. 21 Y4” center to center: $25.50 $24.50 NO BID $23.75 $28.00
Item #6 Awarded 1st Low 4th Low 2nd Low 2nd Low
Spreader Chains: pintle link: D88K, bar flight: (Price Per Foot)
6 ¥8” x 1 47, bar flight location: every other link, Widths: $26.32 $29.50 NO BID $28.00 $28.00
bar flight to be double welded at each end 20 center to center:
TBD by Highway Dept by Item at | TBD by Highway Dept by Item at | TBD by Highway Dept by Item at TBD by Highway Dept by Item at
Item #'s 7-10 Awarded time or Order time or Order time or Order time or Order
7 Snow Plow Shoes: Moldboard
Attach price list if
8 Snow Plow Shoes: Wing Shoe (8 & 12: combo offering discount
centers) Moldboard from list.
20% - See Attached See Attached 20-30% - See Attached NO BID 25% - See Attached
9 Frame Shoe-one way State Percentage:
] %
10 Nosepiece

* 6 WEEK LEAD TIME ARO
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