. Broome County Division of Purchasing
' Debra A. Preston, County Executive . John A. Flynn, Jr, Director of Purchasing

NOTICE OF VARIOUS BID AWARDS

May 11,2016

To Whom It May Concern:

This shall advise you that on May 11, 2016 the Board of Acquisition and Contract accepted your bids of April 13, -
2016 for furnishing the following to Broome County:

BID #: 2016-038

CA #: 1618

BID TITLE:  Groceries & Selected Meats/Fish
AMOUNT: Various

TERM: 05/01/2016 — 06/30/2016

~ Purchase order(s) will be forthcoming upon receipt of a certificate of insurance in compliance with the insurance
requirements as stated in the specifications. Incorrect insurance certificates will cause delays in payment.

If you have not submitted the proper insurance certificate, please send/fax a copy to Tom Dellapenna, Risk

Manager, Broome County Office of Risk Management, County Office Building, 3" Floor, 60 Hawley

Street, P.O. Box 1766, Binghamton, NY 13902-1766. Phone: (607) 778-2402 Fax #: (607) 778-6009.
IMPORTANT: Please include the bid title and bid number on the insurance certificate.

If you have any questions concerning this award, please telephone the Director of Central Foods at (607) 785-
9567. '

Very truly yours,

poasrip

John A. Flynn, Jr.
Director

JAF ksu

Broome County Office Building . 60 Hawley Street . PO.Box 1766 . Binghamton, New York 13902
Phone: (607) 778-2188 . Fax:(607) 778-2346 . www.gobroomecounty.com




Awarded Vendors:

Bernard Food Industries, Inc.
- P.O. Box 1497

Evanston, IL. 60204

Phone: 800 323-3663

Fax #: 800 962-1546
ron{@bernardfoods.com

Ginsberg’s Institutional Foods, Inc.

P. O. Box 17, Route 66
Hudson, NY 12534

Phone: 518 828-4004, Ext. 250
800 #: 999-6006

Fax #: 518 828-8728
msmith@ginsbergsfoods.com

Maines Paper & Food Service, Inc.

101 Broome Corp Parkway
Conklin, NY 1748

Phone: 607-779-1200

Fax #: 800-676-3245
Barb.howwath(@maines.net
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U.S. Foods Albany

755 Pierce Road

Clifton Park NY 12065

Phone: 800-732-1732

Fax: 518-877-3929
Gabriella.weaver@usfoods.com

Sysco Syracuse, LLC

2508 Warner’s Road
Warners, NY 13164
Phone: 315-672-7000

Fax: 800-726-8004
info@syscosyracuse.com




May 1, 20116 - June 30, 2016

MAYONNAISE, PCS

<= 290 mg sodium/serving 180CS | 800CT |ymiration 200/12gm $7.45 32064 " | Ginsberss
DRESSING 1000 ISL, FAT FR HELLMANN'S OR= 2cs 411 GAL Classic ' 4/1 galion 1 SYSCO
DRESSING 1000 ISLAND PC CUPS 10CS 200/CS Kraft 100/cs 11 SYsco
e cerwrzos | oo | o P
: NO BID

SALT SUBSTITUTE PC'S _3CS 2000 CT 2000 ¢t . 0.00 13 SYSCO
MUFFIN MIX, APPLESAUCE CINNAMON-PILLSBUR 368 | 658 | yumedal 15 | Ginsbergs
FOOD COLOR- BLUE 2PT 1PT _ NO BID 186 US Foods
SNACK COOKIE JUNGLE BK WHOLE GRAIN 5CSs - | 200/ 0z 19 SYSCO
SNACK FRENCH TOAST CINNAMANIA 5CS . | 100/1.76 OZ NG BID 19 | US Foods
SNACK MIX MORNING MIXUPS 5CS | 10411502 NG BID 19 | USFoods
CHICKEN PULLED RAW STRIPS STIR FRY WHITEMEAT | 30CS 258 Classic 25% 0.00 29 |  SYSCO .
CHICKEN RIBLET BBQ FULLY CKD BONELESS A s00s. | 1605302 . NG BID 29 | US Foods
POLLOCK UNBREADED GRADE A WEDGE- HIGH LINEROR| _ 5¢s | 802,602 30 SYsco
SALMON BOAT STUFFED-3.2 OZ READY TO GOOK 2008 | som20z NO BID. 3 | USFoods
CLAMS CHOPPED 408 | 125107 |ye navest $84.90 42024 1 | Ginsbergs
TUNA WATER PCK-LT INDIVIDUAL 3Cs sshoz | classio 2406 oz 38.22 8524282 1 SYSCO.
wa»c%wquww _w:o_wwwa eening. brefer <c 140 ma 60CS 6/66.5 PACKER 6/66.5 OZ $33.94 6462 1 Maines
st be <= 280 mg scgimysaning, prefer <= 140 mg 800S | 6/6850Z | rdgreenimon 610650z |3 6105| 8345892 1 | USFoods
o adcod s ﬂm mww%m : <%>Mmowwhm sodium 40Cs 10 oot royal $2850 . | 43085 2 | Ginsberss
e kot suat, o o oo i, 0, ekl st 22508 | OHOON |oppionay srrao | 0 | 2 | Gmsberss
Wmﬂ%ﬁﬂmﬂ i I ocv sveup, o akiad sochumt scs 247308 MUSSELMAN _ 8146 0Z 23.19| 2286313 2 | USFoods
”M MWMM>M0mMW __,.n_vmwm wh, www_wqmovmwmwhwuaﬁw eetened 30Cs 72/4 .ON applesnax $13.89 43210 2 Ginsbergs :

NO BID

NO BID.

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

.NO BID

. NO BID

NO BID

. 'NOBID

NO BID

X % X X X

GINSBERG'S .




May 1, 2016 - June 30, 2016

APRICOT HALVES UNP US GRADE B water/juice pak

no added sugar, no added sodium . 2008 | SHI0ON oo oy $34.90 43400 Ginsbergs
i M_ﬂm.ma HALVES, MARAGHINO, REDFANCY watelooe | 1G5 | am GAL |y s o insborgs
CRANBERRY SAUCE, JELLIED-PC PULL TAB/TUS 10cs | 200CT Ocean Spray 200t 266 19278136 SYsco
Lo Suc Mo wwmmm_.“m‘w_%wﬂc Ay : 8CS | OMIOCN |npykist $33.99 43620 Ginsbergs
Low suger o i svester Lon sodun. ____ 205 | 100N |ovean spray ootz T Ginsbergs
.u%c: CUP, DICED MIX-JUICE PACK IND. GUP smﬁmsc_a 100 | 49107 |y pomen serin 1055 15850 Ginsbergs
FRUIT MIX TROPICAL-DELMONTE OR EQUAL 75CS | 610CN Packer 6410 34.87 4744767 SYSCO
noacied suger oo addes s 00S | 6#10 oo royar | ssors | aomes Ginsbergs.
MANDARIN ORANGE WHOLE SEGMENTS-RW 10CS_ | eAHOON packer 610 22,07 1009208 sysco
o adtied sugar o saced sodum | 8508 | #10 |t so1s0 | assio Ginsbergs
PEACHES, DICED-U.S. GRADE B (CHOICE) 10cs | awaoz sysco classic 48/4 0z 2525 2603013 svsco
|PEARS SLICES, BARTLETT-PEELED US GRADE B s0cs 610 Premium 810 29.49 8538352 SYSCO
Wm_w_»w. DICED, BARTLETT-PEELED US GRD Bwateriiee. | o0.cq | sioon |, 2525 o insborgs
PINEAPPLE CHUNK JP USGRADEB . .2005 | emt0cN Premium 64410 28,88 1097872 . SYSCO
| o et sagar. no acged sodum e | 6008 | 80 o marng s00 | asom Ginsberge
Mﬂmnmw wm Mowh_wwam_macmmemm.» DF Avatedos pak 40CS | BMI0CN |q e $27.50 45290 Ginsbergs
Mv. M%uax%_m.w\wm ﬂuwmww% Woum.,nm torliice pak 6CS 8410 MON-D 6/#10 GN’ 3260] 6328231 US Foods
2o added suger. no adced sochn 25CS | SHI0CN | - SUNSWEET - 6/#10 ON 7668| 6039234 US Foods
St h_nmmmwwﬁm@ﬂwmm_mwwlmmm@ 5CS | S#10CN | nwiTopHR 6/#10 CN 28.57) 6331008 US Foods
a0 m_wmwa_wﬂ“wmnm Mw%mwwom i 10CS | eM10CN |y T1oPHR 6410 CN $45.85 9330994 US Foods
) o v acchurmlstndion, lon e 10CS | SHMOCN MONARCH 8/#10 CN $53.80 7330996 . US Foods
nww_mmm._ac%mmm clowsodum e e 5CS | 80640Z | sHRST/MON 8/640Z_ 14.79| 5340260 US Foods
APRICOT NECTAR-U.S. GRADE A s0cs | 121480z imperial 12146 oz 3046 4111217 SYSCO

X

XX XX X X X X

GINSBERG'S




May 1, 2016 - June 30, 2016

CAPRI 100 % JUICE BOX

No added sugar. low sodium - 15CS 40/6.75 OZ capri 40/6z $14.20 50167 . Ginsbergs
Noshces subetiiiee. bw ot E_om. . 10CS | ¥®49Z |ocean spray $25.75 26802 Cinsbergs
m”u%%ﬂmﬂhﬁﬂﬂw%ﬂ%h%woWth%mM e 50Cs 816402 |osean spray 860z $23.65 50065 Ginsbergs
mmm%ﬂmﬂm,xmmﬂwvwmm MWH M c_OmﬂvSmM.,_o peotooee | acs 864 0Z |osean s $26.40 50132 , Ginsbergs
5 Yrup, 1ow sodium an spray K :
FRUIT PUNCH-PLASTIC 8/60 OZ 30CS | 86407 | Hawaiin Punch 8/64 oz _ 12.37 8141657 SYSCO
GRAPE JUICE, UNSWEETENED-U'S. GRADE A, 100 % 08| 0 o a4 on . .. . US Foods
No added sugar. low sodium ’ THIRST/MON AN\mm [o¥4 22.53 5327408
GRAPEFRUIT JUICE, UNSWEETENED US.GRADE A 20Cs | 8640z |  Ocean Spray 8/50 0z 20.04 5623083 sYsco
LEMON JUICE UNS-FULL STRENGTH, BOTTLE 708 121320z | oo $12.75 50062 Ginsbergs
Z_—xm_u./\mnwm.ﬁ>mrm JUICE U.S. GRADE A ._O. CS m\g [or4 /.\lm 12/46 oz 24.51 4019139 SYSCO
mmwu%mm Mmm_wmw._,_uuom_w\mmw?m._.m 100 % juice 2cs 96/4 0Z US Foods
- S ARDMORE FM - 96/4 0Z 16.24] 8117632
Mo ecod mwmzw,\,_ﬁq H&ﬂv U.S- GRADEA 1T ..“ 0CS | 8B40z lnubykist 120462 $26.05 51415 Ginsbergs
ﬁﬂmzm UNSWEETENED-US GREDEABOTTLES 100% | co0c | 1002 | roumeren e o2 o US Foods
TOMATO JUICE, VEGETABLE- 200S | 12460z '|  campbel 12146 0z - 16.31 4081584 SYSCO
Hmvw_s%wmaﬁmwa,\\mwwﬂmgrm. 20CS | 485502 |4 /5 $23.40 26880 Ginsbergs
mmme‘»%n vwowwn\wwﬂmw m__MwM% MZ. v e T 30CS | eM10CN MONARCH 6410 CN_ $19.67 7327315 'US Foods
| BUTTERSCOTCH PUDDING-RTSFRST QUALTY No T | 1905 | aroon ONARGH 10 O o146 arra1s US Foods
—smmn Haﬂﬂwmwum.mxww_“wmwﬂ oAtTYRo T el | roos S#10CN | HARVESTVL 6/#10 CN $20.63 1327337 US Foods
e e oo o N . 3008 | eml0CN MONARGH 6/#10 CN $21.22 9327313 US Foods
Mow_wﬁ_vu %wﬁmﬁ%ﬁﬁﬁw&wﬂ_w NoTrens et 30CS | GMMOCN' |  MONARCH 6410 CN $25.82 2327328 US Foads
TAPIOCA PUDDINGIVANFRTS-FIRST QUALTTY No Trane 200s | ertoon ONARGH 10 Cn 2508 o307 \US Fooas
VANILLA PUDDING-RTS-FIRST QUALITY 3008 || #10CN | apvesTwvi 67410 ON s18:91 — US Foods
oy m%uxam.wmw_.w&/m\whmvm.oa oW SODIUN 1CS | 8MO0CT |nerbox 6/50ct $39.50 90998 Ginsbergs
Mn: wmﬂﬂ_%%%bmmﬂmﬂ_u IND EZ-OPEN CAMPBELLS 208 | 247250Z |  cAMPBELL 2417.25 0Z 16.17| 4007951  US Foods

XX X X X X X X X x X

X X X X

X
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May 1, 2016 - June 30, 2016

bl %M_whmv%%%%\wm:mm@_u.ggvmm._._.m. OREREA 208 12/5002 CAMPBELL 12/50 OZ 5455 3000200 US Foods

|5 560 o sodomoepang. - CANPRETS oFT 4cs | 1S CAMPBELL 12/49.5 OZ 35.42] 7007941 U$ Foods
Mm_w\_%uﬁwam%ommbﬂwﬂwﬁmz CRMPRESE 3CS | 247250Z |  campBELL 24/7.25 0Z 1560 70079858 US Foods
TOMATO SOUP-CAMPBELLS OR EQUAL 2CS 12/51 oz Heinz 12/51 oz 33.43 4040380 sysco X
Mumwwmww_.mm me_HMx%.oévmmrrm OR EQUAL 20s | tz#soN | oo w0075 50255, Ginsbergs

pbells oz _$80.;

BEEF BASE 1#=5 GAL FRANKLIN COLONY OR = 6CS 12/1# HARVEST VL 121 LB 1296 | savsses © US Foods
BEEF BASE 1#=5 GAL FRANKLIN OR= BEEF 1STINGRED, | 15 PAILS 30# LEGOUT 11304 $66.42 234284 Maines X
CHICKEN 1#=5 GAL ﬂ”)Z—AF_Z, COLONY OW4H R, 8CS 12/1# ) KATYS —A_L_.OImZ 12/1 LB $31.46 234657 . Maines X
CHICKEN BASE 1#=5 GAL FRANKLIN OR=CHIX 1ST INGRED 15 PAILS 30# LEGOUT 11304 $64.62 234302 Naines | X
HAM BASE-1#=5 GAL LE GOUT OR EQUAL ‘acs 121 CLSG TUREE o1 LB 1846 | 4333484 US Foods
MUSHROOM BASE-1#=5 GAL-LE GOUT OR EQUAL 4cs | emsoz 'MINORS - 6/11LB $34.05 234745 Maines X
VEGETARIAN BASE 1#=5 GAL-LE GOUT OR = 4cs 61 CLSC TUREE . 0o7 | osasass US Foods

|BAKED BEANS-GRANDMA BROWNS 20CS 610 GrBrown /10 40.18 5128724 sysco X
BEANS BLACK CND US GRADE A 200 610 . . Ginsbergs
<= 140 mg sodium/serving OR no added salt . sunny farm $17.95 89545
Wum\“,”_% :/._\n_um Moﬂﬁﬁ“ﬂwam Ogom >‘ 2008 BA#10 comsource - , $18.80 90440 Ginsbergs
S NN R N I
Amum”,u% %Mommuh.auwmﬂﬁuw MM mu wmmwaowwm, PEA 20CS BH#10  lfyrmano $1945 | - sssso Ginsbergs
BEANS, GREEN CUT US GRADE A 120CS | 610 CN ‘Sunny farm 610 18.96 ' 8538348 sysco X
BEANS, GREEN FRENCH CUT-US GRADE A 10CS | 6H10ON. Classic 6/410 26.81 4062568 sysco X
BEANS, ITALIAN CUT U.S. GRADE A 10CS 6/#10.CN Classic 6410 28.97 4707188 sysco X
W0 1 sochuisening OR o added sait 5005 | 00 |unry fam 52070 | - so020 Ginsbergs
BEANS, PINTO U.S. GRADE A _ 10CS | 6HH0CN CasaSolana. 6710 21.07 3362274 sysco X
BEANS, SALAD(THREE BEAN) US GRADE 20CS 10" | Cissic 6/#10 2787 4000762 sysco %
D 240 m0 sodumserving OF o added sai 25CS | S#10CN lsunny fam $16.99 90545 Ginsbergs
BEETS WHOLE BABY U.S. GRADE A 20CS | em#10CN Classic 810 30.51 4182317 sysco X

X x X X

" GINSBERG'S




May 1, 2016 - June 30, 2016

BEETS, SLICED-U.S. GRADE A 30CS 61410 Reliance 64410 20.08 0173740 SYSCO
b wwooq.ﬂ.__,w Moﬂﬂm%mm%hﬂﬂbﬁﬁ&& sait 208 O#10  |sunny tarm $18.65 91190 Ginsbergs
y farm :
mu _Ammﬂm%mmommawﬁmﬂ\/ox no added salt 8cs 6#10  |sunny.farm $16.85 91385 Ginsbergs
CORN, CREAMSTYLE-US GRADE A 15Cs | eM100N Reliance A 64410 22.84 0582106 SYSCO
R_n_vmmw Mmmw_ww_\.wmwm«nm o_um._q.dwwmmw wan.wx)om A 60CS 6#10  |sunny farm $21.95 91700 ' Ginsbergs
e W T OO
Mwwm WQMMP%M%NM no added salt 12¢8 SHTOCN _{port royal _mmo.qm . 92495  Ginsbergs
m_.njmnﬁwmowﬂ_mﬂumz.so 3cs 24/14 0z INTL GREEN 2411402 2665 333488 US Foods
= 140 mg soduumsening OF o acded salt - 5005 | G#I0ON oo ropa szoos | oases Ginsbergs
,w ﬁﬁﬂmwkﬂﬂ%%ﬁﬂﬂ%%mﬂww GRADE A 50CS | EMI0CN" |4, 4225 es450 Ginsbergs
POTATOES-DICED, WHITE-US GRADE A s0cs | sm10CN ' Classic 6/#10 25.19 4108866 SYSCO
|PUMPKIN SOLID PACK -US GRADE A scs 61410 Imperial 6710 35.58 4211751 SYSCO
= 120 ”M»,wwmwuuwmwwomc.cm erpEa tocs A0 lsiiver floss . $26.50 93765 Ginsbergs
SPINAGH WHOLE LEAF USGRADEA . ___ ‘10Cs 6/4#10 Popeyes 6110 25.87 4349376 SYSCO
° ﬁamaﬂwmﬁﬂwﬂm”%.zo MORE TRAN 25% S 20CS | 600N ROSELI 6410 CN s2.40] 2329431 US-Foods
= 360 ma sodomisenvog, 2008 | GH10CN |nmang $16.40 88375 Ginsbergs
Hm“skwﬁmw M%W%M_quwnmc_.x PACIUS GRADEA 200 CS SCGAL  lrumano BH10 $16.99 88510 Ginsbergs
Mmm_m%m_w»w_wcum REDTOSALTAREY 100cs 1) 6AHO ANGELA MIA 8410 CN 21.97 | . 1706514 US Foods
= n\_maaommm%wm mmmxﬂmwm ooy 20cs | BH#I0 |omang . $16.99 88510 Ginsbergs
Hm _“\,M,_.Mm wo%“mwwmﬁu% CEUS GRADEA 100CS | SH0CN |4 mang $16.95 89005 Ginsbergs
Hﬁqawwwm Mmqm_vumm_‘ﬂrwm GRADE A 60 CS 610 furmano $17.40 89260 Q:wumam
mu_._ﬂwwqu _%m_m%ww_ww_w 2¢c8 S0 INTL GREEN 6/#10 CN 20.74] 7333479 US Foods
OLIVES, GREEN, STUFFED 1cs 411 GAL Ottimo " 41 galion 39.35 5875941, SYSCO

X

X

XX XX X X X

x

X X X X X xX X X X
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May 1, 2016 - June 30, 2016

PICKLE RELISH, SWEET- FIRST QUALITY

X X X X

X

XUX XX X XX

<= 140 mg sodium/servin 6Cs 411 GAL HARVEST VL 411 GA 19.95| 2699270 s US Foods:
m_uom_wmmawwmw_wdwwkﬂmw 10cs | ancAL B&G 411 GA 25.37| 3983301 S | USFoods
Hoﬁ_wmmmw_o_m_.aﬂv\W:mm%_qu QUALITY 3Cs 4MGAL |k . $27.50 73120 ‘9 Ginsbergs -
PICKLES, SWEET CHIPS FIRST QUALITY 3Cs 411 GAL BaG 4iGA o537l 3983301 9 US Foods
JELLY ASSORTED, PC'S 650CS | 400/50Z | AMERICANA 1/200 CT $6.68 8270 10 Mainies
JELLY, DIET, ASSORTED,PC'S 60CS 200 CT SMUCKER 200/3/8 OZ $13.93 307249 10 |  Maines
JELLY, GRAPE 1ST QUALITY (NO GLASS JARS) 60CS | 6HM0CN Bl 3171 4184453 10 SYsco
JELLY, SUGAR FREE ASSORTED PC'S 200/CS opi reduced calorie $12.70 27570 10 | Ginsbergs
JELLY, SUGAR FREE ASSORTED, PC'S 200/CS SMUCKERS - .NOO\.wﬂm oz 12.96 9501354 1o us WOOQM
MARMALADE, ORANGE (NO GLASS JARS) 1CS | 6M10CN [CARRIAGE HOUSE 610 $56.90 303180 10 | Maines
DRESSING BLUE CHEESE, PC CUPS 1008 200/CS House rec 128/1.5 oz 27.12 9306051 11 SYSCO
DRESSING COLE SLAW -1ST QUALITY _ 25Cs. | 4MGAL Classic 4/1 galion” 35.18 5012043 11 SYSCO
= wwom ﬁ% moﬂ_wcmq_,,_\mh,.\_.mwmoo o= 4Cs 4GAL liens $29.65 30120 11 | Ginsbergs
DRESSING, ITALIAN, DIET PC'S 20CS- 200 CT Nestle N 200 ¢t 17.97 5520045 | " 11 SYSCO
DRESSING, ITALIAN, PC_CUPS 70CS 200 CT 13.93 - 4949897 11| svsco
= 290 me sodiumiservng 4Cs | 4MGAL | parvesTwvi a1ca 16.26] ~_ 2328708 1. | USFoods
DRESSING, LOW FAT BALSAMIC VINAIGRETTE | 2cs | ancaL Ken's 41 galion 31.36 8491102 11 SYSCO
| mewom ”w om_o_%%:,“\mwumnwng SYSCOOR = 4cs 411 GAL KENS " 41GAL $34.80 301325 11 Maines
mwww% ﬁ% w_v%csgﬂww_.ﬂb,gz. SYSCOOR = 4cs 411 GAL KENS 411 GAL $21.15 301445 11 Maines
oK mmm_w% ﬁ% m.o%ﬁ\w.ﬁmwzoz. SYSCOOR= 4cs 411 GAL KENS 411 GAL $33.01 . 301742 11 Maines
DRESSING, RANCH, PC_CUPS 10CS 200 CT House rec 200 ct 13.16 5112735 11 SYSCO'
DRESSING, RANCH, SYSCO OR = 4cs 4IGAL Reliance 4/1 galion 33.41 5740592 11 SYSCO
DRESSING, SUN DRIED TOMATO VINEG KENS/= 4Cs 411 GAL Imperial 2/1 galion 23.99 6617666 11 SYSCO~_
e 200 g sogumiservng 1568 | 41GAL |  MONARCH 41 GA 2198 5328328 1 | USFoods
S 260 g soalmserving 20Cs | el HARVEST VL a1 GA 1915 7320113 11 | USFoods

- X
X

GINSBERG'S




May1, 2016 - June 30, 2016

SALAD ommmm_zm.ﬁmx_o.»z_om = 90Cs. -| - 411 GAL Reliance 4/1 gallon 25.44 - 4002473 | 11 SYSCO
BARBEQUE SAUCE-1ST QUALITY 106S | 4MGAL Marzetti 4/1 gallon 31.70 5521794 12.| sYsco
= wmwﬁh% mmonﬂm%hmmgmm wwwmam_wo_waowyca 4cs 144 cT BULLSEYE .100/1 OZ 0.97| 300799 12 | USFoods
CARAMEL SAUCE SQUEEZE BOTTLE scs | 12ms250z|  sSmuckers - 12120 oz 26.11 5949755 12 SYsco
W__Nw%wmmmmaa\wmzag 208 B/#10CN MON-D 610 ON 2071] 2488810 12 | USFoods
CHOCOLATE SYRUP -HERSHEY'S OR = 4GS 411 GAL MONARGH 411 GA s 2758| 835548 12 US Foods
CORN w/\_nwc.ﬂ..._l_OIq_. 1CS 4/1 GAL MONARCH 4/1 GA $ 32.43 1373935 ‘ 12 us _WOOQM .
DLJON MUSTARD 1¢8 63202 | ary POUPON 6124 OF s s02s| 7o0sers | 12 | USFoods
GRAVY BROWN READT TO SERVE LE GOUT OR .h 5CS ' 12/50 OZ Classic 12/50 oz 29.68 4188023 12 SYSCO

1 500 o sacmionming. o VTR OR focs s#10 HOME TASTE ~_6M10CN s34 3351475 12 | USFoods
a0, ﬁwmpwwﬁumvﬁmozmz PoPaTEToR= 75QT | 12B20Z liitchen bouguet . $82.05 76895 12 | Ginsbergs.
HONEY, PC'S 5CS 500/CS |40+ 200/90m $15.75 50698 12 | Ginsbergs
HONEY, PURE WHITE “1cs 6/5¢ | KATY'S KITCHEN 6518 $86.27 306362 12 Maines
HORSERADISH PC'S scs 200CT | PORTION PAC 200112 GM $16.08 308470 | 12 | Maines
KETCHUP -BULK PACK-US GRADE A - 50CS 3 GAL House recipe_ 3 gallon 16.17 6396949 12 SYSCO
%Mmﬂc.mwmmwdmgom a 20CS | GHMOCN |0 royal . $19.35 87525 12 | Ginsbergs
A 12008 | s00CT |goa 65.20 sr7sa 12 | Ginsbergs -
LEMON JUICE, PC'S 1cs 500/CS CULINARY 1/500/4GR $11.68 24951 12 ‘Maines

N SECRET . :

|MAPLE SYRUP BOTTLES scs | 2440z CARYS 1212 0Z $16.00 907170 12 Maines
MAPLE SYRUP BOTTLES scs | 2ap4oz oasis 4/1 galion 2059 7270741 12 SYsCo
MAPLE SYRUP, IMITATION, PC CUPS 40Cs | tooCT MONARCH ooz |s  ess| 5300644 12 | USFoods
MAPLE SYRUP, SUGAR FREE PC'S 5Cs 200 CT MONARGH 1001 OZ s 778| 'sseesay | 12 | USFoods
MOLASSES, DARK -US GRADE B 108 4/1GAL | HORN OF PLENTY 411 GAL $39.02 389565 12 Maines
MUSTARD, PC'S 80CS 500 CT AMERICANA 1/500 CT $4.97 8282 12 Maines

X
X

%

X X X X

x X X X

GINSBERG'S




May 1, 2016 - June 30, 2016

MUSTARD, PREPARED- 1ST QUALITY

-4CS 4198 |oymiration $11.35 32175 12 | Ginsbergs

NON-DAIRY O_Nm>_<_mm-_u0<<0mﬁ.mr>._. PK, Z.O cup 30CsS 1000 MONARCH 2000 EA $ . 18.42 7436454 12 US Foods
PAN OO).:zO-<<mmeZ OR EQUAL 20CS 6/17 OZ I>_"~<mm.ﬂ<_-. 6/16.5 .ON $ 8.12 8328700 12 US Foods
PEANUT BUTTER, CREAMY-TEDDIE OR=1STQ, . S
<= 290 mg sodium/serving : 120C8 6/5% Hampton farms 6/5 LB $ 37.86 6756811 12 US Foods
PEANUT BUTTER, PC'S, : . .
<= 200 mg sodium/servin socs 200CT MONARCH 2001.75 0Z 18.48| 4969739 12 | US Foods
PICKLE RELISH, SWEET, PC'S C i
<= 200 mg sodium/serving 10CS S00CT 440 4 200/9 gm $7.65 73501 12 | Ginsbergs
RAISINS, SEEDLESS-1ST QUALITY 8CS ) 24/15 O.N PACKER 24/15 OZ $ 34.88 mom.ﬂ..ma 12 US Foods
m>wnmmmﬁ< m>c0m., SQUEEZE BTL 2CS 1215 0Z LYONS MAGNUS .A.N:m oz $25.39 304798 12 Maines
SALAD OIL, VEGETABLE 1ST QUALITY Trans fat Free 40CS 8M GAL |y ion $27.50 63280 . .,B Ginsbergs
SAUCE TERIYAK! - 2CS 4/1 GAL La Choy 4/1 gallon 42.15 4510368 12 SYSCO
SOY SAUCE 1Cs 4/4 GAL Kikoman 4/1 gallon 41.06 - 4005567 12 SYSCO
SPAGHETTI SAUCE RTS HANOVER OR EQUAL N ;
must be <= 480 mq sodium/serving, prefer <= 360 mg 2068 B/#10 CN MON-D 6/#10 CN 17.04 7328503 12 c.m Foods
TABASCO SAUCE 1CS 24/60Z | dihenn ey 121122 ) $66.50 23250 12 ' Q.Smcm_dm
TACO SAUCE-PC'S MILD-PPI OR = 50 CS . 500/CS AMERICANA 1/500 CT $11.18 8290 12 Maines
TARTAR m>c0m. PC'S 100CS 500 CT AMERICANA 1/200 CT 3656 8286 .12 Maines

] VINEGAR, CIDER-5% ACETIC 10 CS 4/1 gal admiration - $8.34 33670 12 Ginsbergs
VINEGAR, TABLE PC'S 4CS -200CT HEINZ 200/9 GR $8.96 306887 12 Maines
VINEGAR, WHITE-5% >Om+_0 2CS 4/1 GAL OASIS 4/1 GAL $6.21 305866 .12 ?_mm:m.m
WORCHESTERSHIRE SAUCE-1ST QUALITY 3CS 4/1 GAL Classic 4/1 gallon 25.69 4007894 12 - 'SYSCO
BASIL LEAVES-FRENCH OR EQUAL 6 EA 28 0Z spice co 12/62 $22.75 " 82830 6. m.zwcmam
BAY nm><mw-vmmzoz OR EQUAL 1EA 120Z MONARCH 120z $ 735 760793 . | 13 US Foods
CELERY SALT i 4 EA 320Z Savseason 12/35 0z 52.14 umom_mm.m 13 SYSCO
CELERY SALT, <= 290 mg sodium/serving 4 EA 320Z " lqurkee 6322 6.67/ea " 82990 13 Ginsbergs
CELERY SEED No sodium or reduced sodium 4EA 3202 durkee . 8/162 7 88/ea 83020 .Aw Ginsbergs
CHIL! POWDER 6 EA 16 OZ MONARCH 1802 $ 364 760116 13 US Foods
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CHIVES-FRENCH OR EQUAL 6 EA 1oz MONARCH 102 $ 244 7601 ~.8 13

CINNAMON, GROUND _uxmzo._._ OR= 6EA 16 0Z MONARCH 1802 s 381 5353115 13 US Foods
CLOVES, GROUND-FRENCH OR = 1EA 16 0Z MONARCH A 60z $ 8.21 760678 13 | .US Foods
CREAM OF TARTAR mnmzo: OR= 1EA 320z MONARCH 3207 - s .22 760207 3 US Foods
CUMIN, GROUND-FRIENCH OR = 1EA 1502 MONARCH w0z" $ 451 760629 18 | USFoods
CURRY POWDER-FRENCH OR EQUAL 1EA 170z MONARCH 160" , $ 408 760223 13 US Foods
DILL WEED 3EA 5.0Z MONARCH 550Z $ 474 | 778423 13 | USFoods
GARLIC POWDER-MC CORMICK OR EQUAL 12EA 190Z MONARCH 2107 s 440| 2501161 13 | US Foods
GINGER, GROUND-FRENCH OR EQUAL 1EA 160z MONARGH 1502 s  sss|  7eosos 13 US Foods
LEMON PEPPER SEASCING 3EA 16 02 Imperial 628 oz 61.68 9806480 13 SYSCO
MUSTARD, DRY-FRENCH OR EQUAL 1EA 16 0Z MONARGH 1502 s 250 . qmo&m 13 US Foods
NUTMEG, GROUND-FRENCH OR EQUAL 1EA 16 0Z MONARCH 160z s 6.20 760355 13 US Foods
ONION POWDER-MC CORMICK OR EQUAL 12EA . 2002 MONARCH 2002 s 3.8 sasaz80 | 13| USFoods
OREGANO LEAVES, WHOLE- FRENCH OR EQUAL 1EA 2402 MONARCH 2402 1s 0.53 760850 13 | US Foods
PAPRIKA-FRENCH OR EQUAL . 6EA 16 0Z MONARCH 1802 s 002 760587 13 US Foods
PARSLEY FLAKES -FRENCH OR EQUAL 10 EA 100z MONARCH 1oz s 5.35 760868 13 | * US Foods
PEPER, BLACK TALBE GRIND-MC CORMICK OR = 15 EA 16 0Z NYSID 41444 1787 7313398 13 SYSCO
PEPPER, BLACK PC'S 18Cs | 8M000 |- dy 311000t $6.15 mm.o.wm 13 Ginsbergs
PEPPER, CAYENNE-FRENCH OR EQUAL 1EA 16 OZ Savseason 16 oz 3.44 7306311 13 SYSCO _
PEPPER, WHITE-MC CORMICK OR EQUAL 5EA 1602 ._<_02>x01 A 80z $ 033 6353403 - 13 | US Foods
PICKLING SPICE-MC CORMICK OR EQUAL 3EA 120z MONARCH 1402 ' 442 760645 13 US Foods -
POULTRY SEASONING-FRENCH OR EQUAL 1EA 10 0Z imperial 120z 10.20 5229562 _13 SYSCO
ROSEMARY, LEAVES-FRENCH OR EQUAL 2EA 60Z - MONARCH 60z s 256 760652 13 US Foods
ROTISSERIE CHICKEN SEASONING, MG CORMICK " 2EA 200z Imperial 240z 10.27 7228943 13 SYSCO
SALT FREE SEASONING PC PKT MRS DASH 4cS 300CT MRS DASH . 500/.6 GR s 33.39 8870750 13 US Foods
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SALT IODIZED BOXED lowest sodium choice

24/26 OZ

10CS 24/26 ON . X}..—./\m KITCHEN $11.18 340610 13 Maines
SALT, IODIZED PC'S lowest sodium choice “15CS 61000t [\ 2qor Boam%%m oﬂa tsp $4.20 86840 13 | Ginsbergs
SMOKED LIQUID FLAVORING 1cs at WRIGHTS 1A s as1s| soosers 13 | USFoods
THYME, LEAVES-FRENCH OR EQUAL 1EA 607 |yrmee . 6775 | 85205 13 | Ginsbergs
TUMERIC-FRENCH OR EQUAL | 1EA 1502 |yinee 61152 6.50 85315 13 | ‘Ginsbergs
COFFEE, DECAFFEINATED, INSTANT PC'S 8cs 500 CT Sanka 1000 ct 78.39 sizsses | 14 | svsco
COFFEE, GROUND ROAST, HOTEL GRIND 36Cs | 26z Stnbrsp 1812 oz 57.18 6957898 14 | svsco
COFFEE, GROUND-DECAFFEINATED 10CS 16/12 OZ Stnbrsp 18/12 oz mw..mm. memwo._ 14 SYSCO
EVAPORATED MILK 2CS 24/12 A.VN MEJMSNDQ 24/12 oz 25.87 7719388 14 SYSCO
NONFAT DRY MILK POWDER BULK-REDI OR = 12BAGS | 55#BAG ' Classic 25% 49.05 5398946 14| svsco
TEA BAGS DECAF IND. WRAP W/TAG . 5CS | 5M100CT | g .o $01.75 17860 14 | Ginsbergs
TEA, ORANGE PEKOE IND. WRAP W/TAG 15CS | 10M00ct | gen $24.09 17660, 14 | Ginsbergs.
BISCUIT MIX-PILLSBURY OR EQUAL 0CS | 658 |ioenaity 628,90 7960 15 | Ginsbergs
BISQUICK MIX 2C8 5% |isoick 645,00 7936 15 | - Ginsbergs
BROWNIE MIX - PILLSBURY OR EQUAL 25CS " | 6/6#BOX | conTINENTL o515 s oe14| 7316490 15 | US Foods
CAKE MIX CHOCOLATE-PILLSBURY OR EQUAL 20Cs 6/5% | CONTINENTL MILL 61518 ' $28.46 380003 15 Maines:
CAKE MIX, CARROT WITH FRST-PILLSBURY s6cs 45% oM o5 67.19 4045647 15 | - svsco
CAKE MIX, SPICE-PILLSBURY OR EQUAL 200s | e/s#BOX oM els# 58.66 045704 | 15 | svsco
|CAKE MIX, WHITE-PILLSBURY OR EQUAL 30CS - | 6/5#BOX | . Reliance o5t 23.14 5301601 15 | SYsco
CAKE MIX, YELLOW - PILLSBURY OR EQUAL 30Cs ol Réliance ols# 23.14 5301627 15 |  sYsCo
CHEESECAKE MIX-ROYAL OR EQUAL 208 | &4#BOX | yoONARGH s LD s as77| 1371756 15 | US Foods
CIN. STRU. COFFEE CAKE MIX W/TOPPING PIL 10CS | 454BOX [ oo - s trame fat 52750 050 15 | . Ginsbergs
GINGERBREAD MiX - PILLSBURY OR EQUAL 2508 | e/s#BOX Hospitality o/s 24.25 8946451 15 | svsco
MUFFIN MIX, BASIC-PILLSBURY OR EQUAL 1008 | 6/5#BOX | conTINENTL 518, s  2285| eaissa | 15 | USFoods
MUFFIN MIX, BLUEBERRY-PILLSBURY OR = 3cs 5% | GONTINENTL s os0s| 4cesese 15 | US Foods

6/5LB
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MUFFIN MIX, BRAN-PILLSBURY OR EQUAL 3Cs | e/5#BOX | ol mEDAL 6518 s as27| 7002314 15 | US Foods
MUEFIN MIX, CORN-PILLSBURY OR = 15CS | e/5#BOX | conTINENTL 65 LB s 2328| 2318503 15 | US Foods
MUFFIN MX, ORANGE CRANBERRY-PILLS OR = 3cs | ef5# GOLD MEDAL o5 LB s ss20| go13434 15 | US Foods
MUEFIN MIX-LOW FAT-VARIETY-GEN MILLS 10Cs 6/5# aM 6/54 54.29 5493706 . | 15 SYSCO
PANCAKE MIX COMPLETE ‘ 2¢Cs 6/5# CONTINENTL o5 LB s 18ss| sssozs7 16 | US Foods
ALMOND EXTRACT 2PT PINT MONARCH 1ar $ 444 u% 452 16 | US Foods
BAKING POWDER, DOUSBLE ACTING 1CS 5# comsource m\.% $26.99 xmm; & 16 Ginsbergs
BAKING SODA 268 el HOSPITALTY 121218 $  1479| 1043975 16 | USFoods
CHOCOLATE CHIPS - SUGAR MILL OR EQUAL 2cs 2508 | car mis has frans fat $35.65 56230 16 Ginsbergs
COCOA, CANNED 10-15% BUTTER FAT-HERSHEY' 2 5 logm o5t $78.95 18305 16 | Ginsbergs
COCONUT SHREDDED SHORT 2Cs 10LB SNOWELAKE 10 LB s 2628 5048204 16 | US Foods
CORN STARCH-ARGO OR EQUAL 3cs 50# ARGO - /1 LB s 1589| 4009308 16 | US Foods
FOOD COLOR- GREEN 2PT 16 0Z CULINARY 6/16 OZ $28.62 352110 16 Maines
SECRET .
FOOD COLOR-RED 2PT 16 0Z MONARCH 1QT $ 464 761353 16 US Foods
LEMON EXTRACT 2PT. | 820Z MONARCH P s ss4| 761387 16 | USFoods -
MARSHMALLOWS, MINI-KRAFT OR EQUAL 6CS 24/11B  KRAFT. 1211 LB s . 1720 50764 16 | US Foods
SHORTENING, VEGETABLE-CRISCO OR EQUAL 2cs 12734 RICHTEX 1HM2/3 LB $43.71 12956 16 Maines -
SPRINKLES, CHOCOLATE FLAVORED 1cs 10% TARRIER . 1/i0LB . $20.98 257820 16 Maines
{SPRINKLES, RAINBOW 18 108 TARRIER 111018 $21.34 257818 16 Maines
SPRINKLES, RAINBOW 1CS 10# @ 4l6i $46.15 86190 16 Ginsbergs
VANILLA FLAVORING, IMITATION 4GAL 1GAL  MONARGH 1GA s 4as1| 7otaas | 18 | USFoods
|WHIP TOPPING MiX DRY-DREAM WHIP OR = 15¢s | 121207 Classic 12116 oz 33.62 5107446 16 SYSCO
ENRICHED FLOUR, BLEACHED, ALL PURPOSE | 1smar 20254 Classic 2025 13.31 8379270 17 | svsco
SUGAR FINE GRANULATED 50# 20CS 508 MONARGH 0 LB s  o2300| 8383283 17 | US Foods
SUGAR PACKETS 2000s | 3000CT USFDSVIUSF 2000 EA s 1027| - saz7263 17 | US Foods
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SUGAR SUBSTITUTE, PACKETS SWEET & LOW 30CS 3000 CT. CHEF MARK 12000 CT $15.04 3660 17 Maines
SUGAR, CONFECTIONERS 10X 2008 12/24 MONARCH 1912 LB s 1087 1627215 17 | US Foods
SUGAR, FINE GRANULATED 5# 4GS 854 MONARCH e s 2378 6395610 17 US Foods

[sueAr, LiGHT BROWN 20Cs 12/2# MONARCH 1902 LB s 2084 055387 17 US Foods
{40%) BRAN FLAKES-KELLOGGS OR EQUAL 30CS 96 CT KELLOGG'S - son1soz . |s  s1de | sasoscs 18 US Foods

" IBRAN FLAKES NOT RAISIN BRAN 20 C§ 20# Hospitality 4/35 oz 1328 6700414 . | 18 SYsco
BRAN, UNPROCESSED, QUAKER OR EQUAL 15CS 1218 0Z Hodmills 6/14 oz’ 22.91 0501431 "1 18 SYSCO
CHERRICS-HONEY NUT- KELLOGGS OR EQUAL ‘5CS . 96 CT | oneral mills $16.45 19905 18 Ginsbergs |
CHERRIOS-KELLOGGS OR EQUAL 10CS 868 CT general mills $19.15 9536 18 Ginsbergs
CORN FLAKES BULK-HOSPITALITY OR EQUAL 50 CS 20¢  |ospitality _ 41352 $13.99 11136 18 Ginsbergs -
CORN FLAKES-KELLOGGS OR EQUAL 50 CS 9%8CT | om $19.20 627 18 | . Ginsbergs
CREAM OF RICE-NBC OR EQUAL 60 CS 12/28 0Z House Recige 12728 oz a7.27 0846022 -18 SYSCO
CREAM OF WHEAT INSTANT PC-NBC OR EQUAL 8CS .96 CT CRM WHEAT 1201211 OZ s ars2| 408463 18 US Foods
CREAM OF WHEAT-NBC OR EQUAL 46 BAGS 50# | om . 120282 $17.95 11347 .18 Ginsbergs
OATMEAL, INSTANT PC-QUAKER OR EQUAL 8Cs 48CT | o $8.95 10302 18 Ginsbergs
OATMEAL, QUICK COOKING-QUAKER OR EQUAL 70 BAGS' 508 STURM & SN 5018 s  2342| 4908586 18 .| . US Foods

" |RAISIN BRAN-KELLOGGS OR EQUAL 20CS 9%CT | om " $10.20 " 10397 18 Ginsbergs

.|RICE KRISPIES-KELLOGGS OR EQUAL 30CS 98CT |0 $19.20 10502 18 Ginsbergs
SHREDDED WHEAT-KELLOGGS OR EQUAL " 15 CS 9%CT  liingg 700t . $27.90 10540 18 Ginsbergs
SINGLE SERVE POUCH CEREALS-SWEETENED 100 CS 96 CT GENL MILLS 967,95 02 $ . 4169 .ﬂmmﬂ 11 18 .| us Foods
SPECIAL K- KELLOGGS OR EQUAL 15CS 96 CT _6.__ 00 $21.30 10605 18 Ginsbergs
TOASTED OATS 20CS 208 Hospitality 4350z  14.10 8732754 18 SYSCO
TOTAL - KELLOGGS OR EQUAL 10CS 96 CT GM 96 ot 25.12 4044541 18 SYSCO
WHEATIES - KELLOGGS OR EQUAL 20CS 96 CT omz L MILLS 70175 0Z s 2075| ooo1s84 18 | US Foods
COOKIE ASST FLAVORS 4 PK 5CS 216/4PK | DARLINGTON s 3434 1351014 19 US Foods
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~us Foods

COOKIE PREBAKED, SOFT & CHEWY SUGAR FREE INOMI[ 20GCs. | “212¢T DARLINGTON szrsoz - |s  4sisa|  1stosoa | 19
COOKIE PREBAKED,SOFT & CHEWY CHOC CH 10Z INDVI|  20CS 216 CT DARLINGTON sei7soz |8 2sae| 2056851 19 | US Foods
CRACKER CRUMBS GRAHM NO ADDED SUGAR 2Cs 10#BAG | - $16.95 7030 19 | Ginsbergs
-|CRACKER MEAL MEDIUM acs I T o5t $17.55 6720 19 | Ginsbergs
CRACKERS GRAHAM BULK-NABISCO OR = - 5Cs 8.1 Nabisco B.A% 2211 7115883 19 SYSCO
CRACKERS, ANIMAL INDIV PKG-KEEBLER OR= 20CS | 20010z [ o 100t 1249 - to7ae | 19 | Ginsbergs
CRACKERS, ASS'T BULK acs 6.254% NABISCO 24 EA s so4s| sosdeia 19 | US Foods
CRACKERS, CINNAMON CRISP GRAHAM PC'S WRP _ 15CS s00CT Pepperidge 300 ct 44.94 0152884 19 | svsco
CRACKERS, GRAHAM PC'S WRAPPED-BURRY OR= 80CS | 2002CT |ioer 615.25 o672 19 | Ginsbergs
CRACKERS, HONEY GRAHAM PC'S WRPD KEBLR = 15CS | 200/2CT Keebler 20012 ct 13.49 5278718 19 SYSCO
CRACKERS, SALTINES PC'S WRP SUNSHINE OR= 35CS | 5002CT | . $9.28 20300 19 | Ginsbergs
CRACKERS, SALTINES, LOW SODIUM, PC'S WRP 12CS | 5002CT. | wamisco PR 50012 EA s  1a4s| ocorsas | 19 | USFoods
CRACKERS/PEANUT BUTTER 8CS’ | 1204CT | . ausTin a6/ EA s17.97 ceo1ass - | 19 | US Foods-
CROUTONS, PLAIN - 2Cs 412,54 MONARGH 5oL ¢ 141s| setosss. | 19 | USFoods
CRUMBS, PLAIN BREAD 3Cs 65 SUGAR FDS o175 LB s ia7e| 7402225 19 | -US Foods
GOLDFISH BAKED SNACK CRACKERS 2CS | 15018107 |  Pepperidge 300775 43.89 8026122 19 SYSCO
PC FIG NEWTONS 2 COOKIES/PKG 10cs | 12020z Field stone 19211.5 4278 7599826 19 SYSCO
POTATO CHIPS, INDIVIDUAL SERV 40CS 6011 oz _Jean's 80t 13.49 5344536 19 SYSCO
POTATO CHIPS-JEANS OR = 170 CS s/t Jean's 8/1# 14.70 5277454 | 19 sYsco
RTS COOKIES CHOC CHIP 24 PKGICS 60CS 104 Nabisco 108 19.15 4125845 19 SYSCO
|RTs cookiEs FiG NEWTONS ocs | zamct Fieldstone 192115 0z 4278 7599826 19 SYSCO
RTS COOKIES VANILLA WAFERS scs | anssoz Nabisco 6113.3 0z 9.36 4240362 19 SYSCO
SCOOBY GRAHAM CRACKER STICKS 2CS | 15010Z | giong 21012 $37.50 49720 19 | Ginsbergs
SNACK MIX-KIDS MIX QUAKER OR = 2C8 | 150780Z [i 1oy 104/ 88ct $28.00 61593 19 | Ginsbergs
TOAST MELBA BULK KEEBLER OR = - 10G8 300/2 OLD LONDON 32012 CT $39.22 320471 19 Maines
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TORTILLA CHIPS-ROGER OR = 10CS S |ocitos 4392 $11.80 62064 19 | Ginsbergs X
BACON BITS . 1CS 20# Reliance sk | 37.96 4062113 20 -|  svsco X

FOOD THICKENER THICK & EASY OR = BULK 10CS | 25POUND |, . $54.36 o7 a,ﬂ , 20 Ginsbergs b
FOOD THICKENER-PC-HONEY CONSIST TH&EASY= | 480CS | 100/CS o . . : . $11.60 27469 20 Ginsbergs . X
FOOD THICKENER-PC-NECTAR CONSIST THEEASY' 650 CS 10cs | , $11.60 . 7ass 20 Ginsbergs X
GELATIN ASSORTED, GITRUS, DIET | ecs 181275 Bemard 18/2.7502 $33.84 506 series 20 Bernard X
GELATIN ASSORTED, REDS, DIET -GAGE OR = 4CS Am\m..«.m Bernard 18/2.75 oz , $33.84 506 series No. Bernard ,x
Om_..>._._z. BLUEBERRY -ROYAL OR = ) 2CS 12/24 OZ Classic 12/24 oz 28.08 5772462 20 SYSCO X

GELATIN, OImﬂW;« -ROYAL OR = o 8CS 12/24 OZ MONARCH 12/24 OZ ‘ $ 21.11 8370322 - 20 us —uon.vam X
GELATIN, LEMON-ROYAL OR = i 1ocs 12/24 OZ MONARCH 12024 OZ $ - 278| 2370668 20 US Foods X
GELATIN, LIME-ROYAL OR = o . 4CS 12124 0Z goz>mo.: ‘ 124 0Z P 6370662 20 US Foods. X
GELATIN, ORANGE-ROYAL OR = , 10CS | 1240z MONARCH - §.m 407 s 2141 1328348 20 US Foods X
GELATIN, RASPBERRY -ROYAL OR= : 10CS | 1240z MONARCH . 12/24 OZ $. 2111 8370660 20 US Foods” . X
GELATIN, STRAWBERRY-ROYAL OR = 106s | 1240z MONARCH 12124 OZ s 2163 |  e370860 20 US Foods X
IND DRINK MIX, ASST FLAVOR, BERNARD OR = . 50CS | 900 EACH Bernard 1000 each $24.00 429 series .| 20 Bermard x
MILK REPLACEMENT DRINK MIX must contain same vitas mi| 50CS [ 1000/250Z | Bemard . 1000 each $43.90 1 452 series 20 - Bemnard X
PUDDING DIET PUMPKIN BID ; o 2Cs 2116 0Z Bernard 121160z $84.00 523523 | 20 Bermard X
PUDDING, CHOCOLATE-SHELF STBL-RTS HUNT= 25CS | 4840z "~ _Hunts . a8/4 oz 14.89 5661582 1 20 sysco %

PUDDING, DIET CHOC-BERNARD OR= 15C8 | 12160Z | - Bemard - 1216 oz $84.00 520063 : 20 Bemard X
PUDDING, DIET VANILLA-BERNARD OR = 15CS 12160z | Bernard 12/16 0z $84.00 |- 520143 20 | Bemard’ X
PUDDING, INSTANT CHOCOLATE . 5CS hospit m:.e 120247 aw 4,60 46770 20 Ginsbergs X
PUDDING, INSTANT VANILLA _ 5CS hospitality |l 120247 $25.75 46775 20 Ginsbergs X
PUDDING, VANILLA-SHELE STABLE-RTS HUNT= 25CS 48/4 oz Hunt's  48l40z . 14.89 5763834 20 sysco X

PUDDING, DIET-BUTTERSCH-BERNARD OR = . | 1scs 12/16 0Z Bernard 12116 0z $84.00 | = 520043 20 | Bemard X
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WHIP AND CHILL CHOCOLATE JELLO OR ="

Bernard

16

2Cs 6144302 Bernard 6/4#3 oz $94.02 516027 20
WHIP AND CHILL STRAWBERRY-JELLO OR= 208 6/4#30Z Bemard Sz or $94.02 516087 20 Bernard
BARLEY,PEARL DRY 3cs 24114 &F FOODS ot L s 1sss| sato67e 21 | US Foods -
COCOA MIX PC-1ST QUALITY 15CS 6/50 RITUALS 6/50 EA- $ 30.95 wwiﬂm, 21 US Foods
OOOO) MIX SUG FREE PC'S 10CS . 6/25 CT RITUALS 3/50/.53 OZ $ 2051 911925 21 US Foods
CORNBREAD STUFFING MIX -UNCLE BEN'S OR = 50CS | eB5LB | KaTY'S KITCHEN 106156 OZ $44.11 18044 21 Maines
FETTUCCINI-EGG ZOOO_.nmm. 100% DURUM WH SEM 2CS 10# ROSEL} 2/1C# 3 11.12 4327870 21 Us Foods
;._m;zq BKFST VANILLA CARNATION scs | emoct CARNATION o35 78GR | o4s| 6221105 21 | USFoods
|MACARONI, ELBOW 100% DURUM WH SEMOL, MED 80Cs 2018 HARVEST VL o0 LB s o55|  s93063 21 | uSFoods
MACARONI, ELBOW HI FIBER DREAM FIELDS OR = 30CS 108 Dream field 10# ‘specorder | 6100624 21 SYSCO
NOODLES DITALINI -PRINCE OR = 10cs 204 ROSEL] JHOLB ‘s 11es| 7apsote | 21 | ~USFoods
NOODLES EGG EXTRA WIDE PRINGE/= 100% DWS socs | 10#8OX oremiam - 50,05 48041 21 | Ginsbergs
NOODLES, LASAGNA CURLY 1005 DUR WH SEM 25CS’ 10LB ROSEL LB Ts  745| 2so8e56 21 | US Foods
ONIONS, DRY GHOPPED-US #1 - , 2cs | e " GILROY 115 LB $35.28 343500 21 Maines
PEAS, GREEN SPLIT DRY-JACK RABBIT OR = 10cs 24118 C&F FOODS a1 LB s 1w77|  7212673 21 | USFoods
POTATO PEARLS IDAHOAN OR = ° 47 BAGS 504 idahoan 6/3.74 54.00 5308721 21 SYSCO
POTATOES DEHYDRATED SLICED 1ST QUALITY 30 BAGS 334 OLDFASHION 6745 LB s. a243| 4007076 21 | USFoods
POTATOES, COMPLETE INST W/ VAT C TRIO/= 30 BAGS S0¥  lune . 610 $37.60 65075 21 | Ginsbergs
POTATOES, DEHYDRATED HASH BROWN 1ST QUAL 15CS 6/2.5% MONARGH 6125 LB s  s270| 2s2e068 21" | US Foods
RIGE, BROWN 1ST QUALITY QUICK COOK 10Cs 25% Uncle Ben's 258 . 29.08 2451243 21 SYSco
RICE, PAR-BOILED 1ST QUALITY 50CS 258 | oo $14.10 04665 21 | Ginsbergs
RIGATONI, 100% DUR WH SEM PRINGE OR = 9.CS 201 Viteli 20# 18.05 7805953 | 21 sYsco
SHELLS-MACARON!, MEDIUM 100% DWS PRNCE/= '6Cs | 20#BOX | arvESTVL . 1o LB s 97| osross 21 | USFoods
SHELLS-MACARONI, SMALL 100% DWS PRINCE/= scs | 20#BOX ROSELI 10 LB s 1i43| ss28023 21 | USFoods
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SPAGHETTI, HI FIBER DREAM FIELDS OR = 30CS 10# Dream field 10# 6100610 21 SYSCOo
SPAGHETTI, REGULAR CUT 100% DWS PRINCE/= 75CS 201b HARVEST VL 2110 LB 5 055!  ge7e02 21 US Foods
SPAGHETTI, REGULAR CUT GLUTEN FREE 3Ccs 108 MONARCH 12/ $03.53 7633365 21 US Foods
SPIRALS, 100% DUR WH SEMOLINA PRINCE/= 40CS 201b HARVEST VL 2110 LB 3 0.7 087627 21 US Foods
ZITI, CUT 100% DU WH SEMOLINA PRINCE/= 12CS 20LB ROSEL 210 LB s 1442 3327684 21 US Foods
APPLE JUICE, UNSWEET PC SUN CUP /= 600 CS 72407 |G nip $7.50 _ »wm.\w 2 Ginsbergs
APRICOT NECTAR, UNSWEET PC'S SUN GUP/= 50 CS 7240Z |ginep $10.30 49806 22 Ginsbergs
BLUEBERRIES, IQF SYSCO OR = . 5CS 30 MONARCH 201B s 4831 1389571 22 | us Foods
CRANBERRY JUICE PC'S SUNCUP OR = 700 CS 72/4 oz suncup . mu..\o. 49991 22 Ginsbergs
- |GRAPE JUICE, UNSWEET PC'S SUN CUP/= 280CS 7214 OZ Ardmore 70/4z s 034 2678811 2 | USFoods
GRAPE JUICE, UNSWEET PC'S SUN CUP/= 280 CS 7240Z o .  $0.60 50366 22 Ginsbergs
LEMONADE oozomzqmﬂ, 711 FRZN MIN MAID/= 6CS 24/120Z | 'MINUTE MAID 12/16 0Z $21.19° 143545 22 Maines
LEMONADE PC'S SUN CUP OR = 30CS’ 72/4 OZ Ardmore 96/4 oz 9.72 ammwoa S 2 _SYSCO
ORANGE JUICE UNSWEET CONCENT3/1 1ST QUAL - 6CS 1218202 | oo $30.50 a S‘mmo K Ginsbergs
ORANGE JUICE, UNSWTND PC'S SUN CUP/= 1000CS | 72402 Ardmore *SPO* 7oKz s .32 mmq..mdm : 22 US Foods
ORANGE JUICE, UNSWTND PC'S SUN CUP/= 1000CS | 7240Z | oo %.mm. 51286 22 Ginsbergs
PINEAPPLE JUICE,UNSWEET PC'S SUN CUP/= 850CS | 72407 [ o “70/4z carton $9.75 51608 22 Ginsbergs
PRUNE JUICE UNSWEET PC'S SUN CUP/= 150 CS 72/4 0Z Suncup 72/4 oz 18.70 6777452 22 sysco
STRAWBERRIES, SLICED " 60CS 666.5% | acker $48.75 45755 22 Ginsbergs
TOMATO JUICE PC’S SUN CUP OR = 80CS 72407 |G o $7.85 51993 2 |. Ginsbergs
APPLE PIE, THAW & SRV-NOT LATTICE 1ST QU 40CS 6 PIES CHEFPIERRE 6/492. s 3323 8012565 - 23 US Foods -
BAGEL PLAIN, LENDERS OR = 10CS 72CT |, speciatty . 75/2.52 $13.20 , 125 23 Ginsbergs
BANANA CREAM PIE-THAW & SRVE 1ST QUALITY 2008 6 PIES CHEFPIERRE 6127 07 s 2638 1037225 23 US Foods
BISCUIT BUTTERMILK 2'/1 OZ BRDGEFRD OR= 5Cs 12068 |priggeford $15.25 204 23 | Ginsbergs
CHEESECAKE FRZ PLAIN PHILA CREAM OR = 10CS Act PHILDLEPHIA 460 OZ s 6435 6220560 23 US Foods,
CHOCOLATE CREAM PIE THAW& SRVE 1ST QUAL . 20Cs 6/27 OZ CHEFPIERRE i 6/27 OZ .a " o714 »&.EB 23 US Foods
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COCONUT CREAM PIE THAW & SERVE 1ST QUAL 20Cs 6/27 0Z CHEFPIERRE 6127 02 s 2480 | 4578472 23
DANISH, ASST INDIV WRAPPED1ST QUAL 75CS .| 24/3.2502 SARA LEE 241395 OZ s 1518] s0177is 23 US Foods
ECLAIRS- FILLED 10CS 48/20Z RICH'S 421202 s 20851 8002148 23 US Foods
ENGLISH MUFFINS 15CS 144CT |y .ﬁ 555 3485 © 23 Ginsbergs
FRENCH TOAST AUNT JEMIMA OR = 20CS 144CT |0 terworth $21.98 2800 23 -|. Ginsbergs
FRENCH TOAST STIX 15CS 10# HILLTOP HR o5 w. 89|  s734298- 23 US Foods
KEY LIME PIE BISTRO COLLECTION INDIV. SARALEE= 10CS | 24,2802 BISTRO GLG 2428 0Z $ o2629| 528453 23 US Foods
LEMON MERINGUE PIE, THAWS SERVE 1ST QUA 20CS 6CT CHEFPIERRE 616 0Z $ . 3164 1037274 23 US Foods
MINI CREAM PUFF - FILLED 15Cs 48/13 0z RICH'S 48/1.33 OZ s  26.82| - s002148 23 US Foods
PANCAKES -AUNT JEMIMA OR = . 400CS | 144/CS HILLTOP HR 1a4CT s 1o0s3| svasss 23| US Foods
PANCAKES MINI MAPLE BURST/STRAWBERRY PILLS= 10Cs 26T |piispury ) 793,557 $28.00 3450/3491 23 | Ginsbergs
PIZZA, SQUARE- CHEESE GIRADI OR = 20Cs 96/EA onys o6/a.52 $43.20 24840° 23 | .Ginsbergs
PUMPKIN PIE THAW&SERVE 10 " 1ST QUAL 20CS 6/40 0Z HILLTOP HR 6143 OZ s - 27.02] asesest 23 US Foods
ROLLS, DINNER WHITE-RTS FROZEN 20CS | 16EACH HILLTOP HR 12830z |8 1sse 1330935 23 US Foods'
STRAWBERRY RHUBARB PIE, BAKE & SRVE 1STQ 20GS 6/46'0Z CHEEPIERRE 6/46 OZ s sora| sosveo2 23 US Foods
WAFFLES- AUNT JEMIMA OR = - | _=0cs 144/CS Mrs Butter 144/cs 11.68 3788908 23 SYSCO
WAFFLES- MINI INDIVIDUAL WRAP-MICROWAVABLE CHILD] 10 CS, 72 Bilsbury 122,472 wﬁ.mo sasomson | 2 Ginsbergs
BURRITO PORK FREE FULLY COOKED 200CS 7215 07 Packer 7214 0z 28.83 5453762 24 SYSCO
CABBAGE ROLLS DRY. PK READY TO COOK 5 0Z 40CS 40/5 0Z Award 48 each 60.58 1642378 24 SYSCO
CABBAGE ROLLS FULL CKD W/ SAUCE CAMPBELL 10CS 4/88 0Z PRES/MOLLY 492 0Z 1s  4s28| 1326305, 24 US Foods
LASAGNA, CHEESE MEATLESS, FULLY COOKED 10CS 4J6# STOUFFER'S - 4196 0Z $49.94 150410 24 Maines
MANICOTTI 4 INCH A 10CS 80 CT Pedro 72ct 24.60 7770734 24 SYSCO
OMELET, INDIV-PLAIN 50 CS 96/2 0Z GLNVW _masm 60/3 0Z s 2301 759191 24 US Foods
PIEROGIES, POTATO & CHEDDAR CHEESE FILL 30CS 4638 | e . $41.88 34750 24 | - Ginsbergs
IPOCKET BREAKFAST EGG/CHEESE/BACON 10CS 32/5 0z . Lamb 32/3.5 0z 25.06 4217550 24 SYSCO
POCKET SANDWICH PORK FREE CHEF >z_mm_o>\.u 150 CS 50/5 OZ SKNGREDBLE a8/5 0F s s0ss|  a1ze4e7 24 US Foods
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2Cs 481cT classic . $30.95 97310 24 Ginsbergs
POTATO, BAKED, STUFFED CHEDDAR RTS PEN/= 2cs 48/CT PENOBSCOT 505 0Z $31.79 184105 24 | Maines
|RAVIOLI CHEESE COOKED ROTANELLI OR = 50 CS 3001.65 ROSELS s s 1763| azatier 24 | USFoods
RAVIOLI MEAT-GOOKED ROTANELLI OR = 25CS 300 CT ROSELI 518 s 1970 | 2620655 24 | USFoods
STUFFED GREEN PEPPERS FULLY COOKED 3cs 4/83 0Z PRESIMOLLY 83 G2 s ao4s| 0326209 24 | USFoods
STUFFED SHELLS, CHEESE 2.75 OZ EA 5Cs 96/2 0Z Sicily 7012.75 oz 21.16 7770755 24 SYSCO
TORTELLINI CHEESE COOKED ROTANELLI OR = 20Cs 43 Redebro 12/1% 20.25 7820821 24 | sysco
EGGS, SCRAMBLED FULLY COOKED-PAPPETTI OR 20 OO. .m\N.,m% TrayRdy . 8/2.5# 40.54 2541183 . 25 m/\.MOO
FROSTY ._-T:O,—A FRZ Ummwmm..—.. MIXED BERRY 10CsS 48/4 OZ MAGIC CUP 48/4 OZ $ 32208 5073077 25 US Foods
FROSTY THICK FRZ DESSERT, MIXED ORANGE 10Cs | 48140z |y 533,95 - 25 | Ginsbergs
MIGHTY SHAKE RTS STRAWBERRY-HORMEL/= s0cs | 75140z Imperial 75/4 0z L 18.24 0104505 25 | -sysco
MIGHTY SHAKE RTS CHOCOLATE NO ADDED SUG - 120CS | 5040Z | ynaHTYSHKS 5074 OZ I 25 | USFoods
- |MIGHTY SHAKE RTS CHOCOLATE HORMEL HLTHI= 7508 | 7smoz Imperial 75/4 0z 18.19 0104497 25 S¥Sco
MIGHTY SHAKE RTS VANILLA NO ADDED SUGAR s0cs | somoz Imperial 50/4 oz 2228 0104521 25 SYSco
MIGHTY SHAKE RTS VANILLA-HORMEL HEALTH/=. 60CS 7514 Imperial _ T5l40z. 18.21 0104059 25 SYSCO
ASPARAGUS CUTS US GRADE A . 1068 | em2sib MONARCH 65 LB s  o736| capsziz | 2 | USFoods
AUTUMN MIX VEGUS GRADE A 10Cs 12028 Classic _ 6last 20.22 5549480 %6 | svsco
BEANS, GREEN ITALIAN STYLE US GRADE A 25Cs 12/2.5% MONARCH 1212 LB s 1505 | 1328260 26 | USFoods
BEANS, GREEN, FRENCH CUT US GRADE A 25Cs 12028 - MONARGH o2 LB s 1645| 4328225 26 | US Foods
BEANS, GREEN, SHORT CUT US GRADE A 50 CS 12028 " NONPAREIL 1120 L8 $12.21 13049 2 Maines
BEANS, GREEN, WHOLE SYSCO CLASSIC OR = 10Cs 12024 . MONARGH 12j2 LB s 1620| sa12887 26 | US Foods
BEANS, WAX, CUT US GRADE A 50CS 12708 MONARCH 1205 LB s 1742| sazsato 26 | USFoods
BROCCOLI CUTS US GRADE A 12008 | 12258 NONPAREIL 1112/2.5 $18.82° 13033 2 Maines
BROCCOLI FLORETS US GRADE A 50 CS 1228 | o arielle 616,40 65430 26 | Ginsbergs
BRUSSEL SPROUTS, MEDIUM US GRADE A 10Cs 12124 MONARGH 12125 LB s 2553| sazesss 26 | USFoods
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CALIFORNIA MIX US GRADE A 150CS | 12028 NONPAREIL 1122 LB $18.75 13050 26 Maines
CARIBBEAN MIX VEGETABLES US GRADE A 45Cs 8/ # Classic 6l4% 30.56 5545801 26 SYSCO
CARROTS, DICED US GRADE B | 150 CS 204 HARVEST VL 20LB T 26 | USFoods
CARROTS, SLICED US GRADE A 160CS | 12258 | i0 20 1025 05555 26 | Ginsbergs
CARROTS, WHOLE BABY US GRADE A 60CS 3108 | crielie . $15.08 05500 26 | Ginsbergs
CAULIFLOWER US GRADE A _ 100 CS 1228 | el $14.15 05625 26 | Ginsbergs
CHATEAU BLEND VEGETABLES 10CS 614k Classic 6l4% 0.00 6453658 26 SYSGO

‘|CORN, WHOLE KERNALUS GRADE A 110CS 20# HARVEST VL 201B 1145 4328233 26 US Foods
COUNTRY MIXED VEG US GRADE A 10Cs 208 MONARGH el sss7 | asessss 26 | USFoods
EGGPLANT CUTLET FIRST QUALITY 10cs 008 g 625,10 34196 26 | Ginsbergs
EMPEROR'S STIR FRY BLEND VEGETABLES 10CS 6144 PACIFC JDE. o4 LB o808 | 740874 26 | USFoods
ISLAND BLEND 10CS 6l4# Classic. 6l4st 30.11 9810599 26 SYsco
ITALIAN MIXED VEG US GRADE A 30CS 20# MONARCH 20LB 58|  sansz0s 26 | USFoods
MIXED VEGETABLES US GRADE A 100Cs 310% | ReovALLEY 2018 17|  orsaszs | % | USFoods
MONTE CARLO BLEND VEGETABLES 10CS 6l4% _ Classic 6/4% 25.06 3533429 26 SYSCO
ONIONS, DICED US GRADE A 100 CS 0B oo, 69.65 o605t 26 | Ginsbergs
ONIONS, PEARL US GRADE A 2¢cs 12/28 MONARCH 12/ LB w207 | 4307631 26 | USFoods
ORIENTAL BLEND US GRADE A 15CS 12024 MONARCH 20LB 1716 | 7308446 26 | USFoods
PEAS AND PEARL ONIONS US GRADE A 30Cs 12/2.5% MONARGH o5 LB TN - 26 | USFoods

|PEAS, SNow PODS - 4cs 12128 NONPAREIL 12128 $26.54 147626 26 Maines
PEAS, SWEET 3- 4 SV US GRADE A 150 CS 31108 HARVEST VL 20LB 1022 | savesar 26 | USFoods
PEPPERS, GREEN SLICED US GRADE A 10CS 20 Arcgard 208 23.60 3421341 26 | SYSCO
PEPPERS, GREEN.DICED US GRADE A 10Cs 12/218 NONPAREIL 172018 $16.46 13040 26 Maines ™
POTATO PUFFS HEAT/SERVE MAPCO OR = 60 CS 6/5t Cavendsh B/5# 19.15 2082774 26 SYSCo

|POTATO PUFFS-SWEET POTATO-SWEET THINGSOR= | 10CS o25% | $19.98 7166 26 | Ginsbergs
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POTATO WEDGES , SKIN ON 30CS L . s18.40 .. 47050 26
POTATOES FRENCH FRIES PRECOOKED BROWNED 25C8 6/54 HARVEST VL /4.5 LB " issal 8327041 26 US Foods
ROMANO MIX US GRADE A 100 CS 12/2LB Imperial 6/4% '25.47 1333186 26 SYsSco
SCANDINAVIAN VEGETABLES US GRADE A - 10CS 208 MONARCH | 64 LE 21.04 dwq&m 26. | US Foods
SPINACH CHOPPED US GRADE A 80-CS 12/3%# Nonpari 12/33% Nw..m._ 7146410 Nm. SYSCO
SQUASH, HUBBARD CKD US GRADE A TUBS PKD 40 CS 12143 MONARCH 1214 _.w sa79| 9329590 . 26 US Foods
SQUASH, YELLOW SLICED US GRADE A 50CS 1202 e , 426,90 Wmmom 26 | Ginsbergs
JSQUASH, ZUCCINI SLICED US GRADE A 150 CS 12728 MONARGH 193 LB 2679 | sazss07 2 US Foods
'WINTER <m0 MIX US 0W>Um.> 30CS 20# MONARCH 2018 17.63 4328316 26 US Foods
BEEF PEPPER STEAK HEAT AND SERVE 10CS 40/4 0z Classic - 4004 0z . 39.57 7097256 27 SYSCO
BEEF POT PIE BANQUET OR = 180CS |. 24770z BANQUET 247 02 1084  sossezr | 27 US Foods
wmmw STEAK-UM'S PHILLY STYLE 20Cs. | 642507 | .o has trans fat $30.95 . 57002 . 27 | Ginsbergs
BEEF, CORNED, COOKED 100 LB 206# Groebel 278 4.609 g2e0068 | 27 SYSCO
BEEF, TOP RND, CHOICE FULLY CKD MED DONE 10CS Pound MrsReeses - 2lo# 3.833 8080459 27 SYSCO -
BEEF/TURKEY/MOZZ CHEESE ITALIANO PATTY, .30CS 120/4 OZ Gd source: 120/ 40z :58.11 3570710 27 $YSCo
CHUCK POT ROAST LOW SODIUM GEM FOODS OR = 10¢S | irogavg Classic 1/ 10# avg 430 5485984 27 SYSCO
HAMBURGER PATTY "PUB TYPE" PRCK_PIERRE OR = 40CS 40/4 0Z maidrite 48/4 oz 43.62 7057140 27 SYSCO_
|HAMBURGER PATTY PRE-CKD BEEF/TURKEY 30Cs | 16012107 “Md Rite 136/2 0z 37.20 0363251 27 SYSCO
MEATBALLS ALL BEEF 1 OZ HEAT & SERVE 250Cs | 16011 0Z Arezzio 160/1 oz 20.71 7673700 27 SYsCo.
MEATBALLS BEEF/CHICKEN 1 OZ HEAT & SERVE 50CS | 160-10Z [pon custo | 1108 $16.08 . 6412 27 | Ginsbergs
MEATLOAF “ALL BEEF" SLCD FL BRLD PIERRE #3330 25CS 80/40Z [ i e 75 a.mN. A $37.76 56445 27 Ginsbergs
MEATLOAF BEEF/CHICKEN HEAT & SERVE 3 07 40CS 120/4 OZ Gd source 120/4 oz 42,87 5772883 27 SYSCO
SALISBURY STEAK ALL BEEF HEAT & SRV 3 OZ 30CS 40/4 oz Good Source 120/4-0z $46.99 2334480 27 | " sYsco
KIELBASI PRE COOKED FARMLAND OR = 100# 2054 - BATUXENT 10 _.m 1042 | eees148 28 | USFoods
PORK BACON FULLY CKD 300 SLICES/CS HORM= 10CS | 8300CT | (oo ) 53099 28 Ginsbergs

20

$24.90

X X X X

=

XX X X

GINSBERG'S




May 1, 2016 - June 30, 2016

PORK BREAKFAST SAUSAGE LINK HEAT & SRVE

10CS

US Foods

$101.12

10LB EMBER FARM 10LB $ Nw.om. mummwmm 28
PORK RIB B Q HEAT & SERVE PIERRE #1830/= 50 CS 100/2.5 Reliance ' 80/2.67 oz 3269 2398188 28 SYSCO
CHICKEN BREAST FILET PLAIN PRECKD 3 OZ 2008 | 100BOZ | ner 100/3.4 OZ 673,60 s3041 20 | Ginsbergs
CHICKEN BREAST BROC/CHS STUFFING 4 OZ 20 CS 36/4 0Z PATUXENT 36/4 OZ s a576|  sesaz7t 29 US Foods
CHICKEN CORDON BLEU 4 OZ 10Cs 36/4 OZ PATUXENT 6407 s ss76| sesdser 29 US Foods
CHICKEN DICED PRE COOKED LIGHT/DARK MEAT 2000# 10% PATUXENT 10 LB s 2088| - 43s2085 2 US Foods
CHICKEN FILET SAVORY READY TO COOK TENDE 20 CS 48/4 0Z Classic s84 0z 33.92 9562644 29 SYSCO
CHICKEN FINGERS, MARINATE BRDED FULLY CK 75CS | 160/ 0Z | 1vsON REDL 25 LR s . 2780 e768080 29 | US Foods
CHICKEN NUGGETS FULLY CKD, BRWN 245 -.64 120CS | 25068 | COUNTRY PRIDE © 102518 $20.95 29476 29 Maines
CHICKEN NUGGETS FULLY CKD, BRWN 245 -.64 120 CS 250168 goldkist 455 WG $40.95 54584 29 | Ginsbergs
CHICKEN PATTIES LT/DARK FULLY CKD, BRND - 20Cs 12014 0Z | 3oypist A/5EWG $41.25 54294 29 | Ginsbergs
CHICKEN POT PIE 60CS. | 2470z BANQUET - 2417 02 s 1984|  e049936 29 US Foods
CHICKEN PULLED LEG MEAT PRECKD IQF TYS/= 10CS 10# PATUXENT o s  2087| 13s27et 20 US Foods
CHICKEN, ROTISSERIE, 1/2'S, FULLY CKD, HERB 20CS | 12HALVES Pierce 30 halves/goz 85.91 0791672 29 SYSCO
BREADED POLLACK NUGGETS HEAT & SRV FPl/= 240Cs | 1eoM0z - Portbty 10# 26.04 7370562 30 SYSCO
COD WEDGE/COUNRTY BREADING OVEN READY 20Cs | 42137 SEA STAR 1018 s s045| 200085 30 - | US Foods
" [FISH AND BATTER WHITING 4 oz HEAT & SERVE 150BX | 10014 0Z Viking - _120/40z 48.80 8945061 30 SYSCO
FISH BEER BATTER FULLY COOKED WEDGES 10CS 80/2 0z Seaside 80/2 oz 36.00 6994867 30 SYSCO
LEMON PEPPER COD _ 20 CS 4040Z | in has trans fat $39.50 41008 30 | - Ginsbergs
|POLLACK BAKE AND SERVE LITE SEASTAR OR= 18CS 10# Port Prime 40/4 oz 0.00 30 SYSCO
POLLACK BONELESS 4 1# RAW UNBRDED 10CS 4108 PoriBty 4104 78:98 2211225 s | - sysco
POLLACK BREADED KRUNGHY LITE 20Cs 40402 | sa/32 $31.10 40268 30 | Ginsbergs
POLLACK BREADED POTATO CRUSTED 10cs | 4smm60z VIKING 10.35 $35.38 1280338 30 | USFoods
POLLACK FILETS FLORENTINE 10CS 40/4 02 VIKING 1018 s s839| 1175847 30 US Foods
POLLACK, ALASKAN FILLET 4 OZ-VENTURE FOODS 280MG 10 CS Atlantic 14414 0z 8518138 30 SYSCO
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SALMON BURGER 3.2 0Z READY TO COOK 10CS | 508202 |pon s5460 41155 30 | Ginsbergs
TURKEY BREAST SKINLESS PRE CKD 3-5 PC NO FILLERS | 100# POUND Carolin 2/t 2499 8832610 31 SYSCO
TURKEY PRECOOKED ENDS/PIECES 130CS | 18LBS JENNIE-O o5 LB o106 | 7213870 31 | USFoods

| TurkeY,PULLED PRE-CK 20Cs 104 JENNIEO 5L ases| 7173504 31 | -US Foods -
AMERICAN CHEESE LOAF WHITE USDA APPR. - 10CS 6i5# EL PASADO o5 LB sass | s730677 82 | USFoods
AMERICAN CHEESE SLICED 120 ST/5# WHITE 70CS 4/5# * Sommermaid /5 36.620 9459082 32 SYSCO
CHEDDAR CHEESE SHRD YELLOW ONLY US OW) 150 CS 4/5# GLNVW FRMS 4/5LB ) wm.m.m 5332630 32 US Foods
GHEESE CHEDDAR SHRP 20 EA 1018 GLNVW FRMS 10LB sias | sasezo %2 | USFoods
CHEESE STRING LOW FAT 10CS 168/1 OZ . ROSELI 168/1 OZ 33.93 8805137 32 US Foods
CHEEZE WHIZ OR EQUAL 3Cs | om0 | has trans fat $36.25 9685 32 | . Ginsbergs
COTTAGE CHEESE 40CS 45t . CABOT 65 LB soea| 3312642 32 | US Foods
COTTAGE CHEESE LOWFAT - 10CS 6/5% o_.z<<<._um_sm, 4/51B 20.80 1685882 32 US Foods
CREAM CHEESE PLAIN PC'S 10Cs | 10010Z i . s16.00 28710 32 | Ginsbergs
CREAM CHEESE USDA APPRV _u.>9.< OR=" 4CS 10/3# - Imperial qora _ 5553 1012566 32 SYSCO
FETA CHEESE 3CS 10# GLNVW FRMS 2/5 LB $21.23 6560577 32 | USFoods
MOZARELLA CHEESE SHRED45-52% MOIST scS 4fsit ROSELI" 4518 ‘3501 | esepsss | 32 | USFoods
MOZZARELLA CHEESEA45-52% MOIST 6CS 86t Arrezzio - g6t 1.796 7484397 32 SYSCO
MOZZERELLA CHEESE SHRED LOW FAT LOL/= 50LB Pound | GREAT LAKES 6218 $29.05 12085 32 Maines
PARMESAN CHEESE GRATED POLLY' PR = 10CS 4/5t Sicily 254 22.05 7841611 32 SYsco
ROMANO CHEESE GRATED POLLY'0 OR = 3cs 4/ss Sicily - 258 22.05 7804065 32 | sYsco
SOUR. CREAM 10Cs, 4/5¢ " CABOT &5 LB w094 | 7181787 32 US Foods-
SOUR CREAM LOW FAT 4CS 45t Whifarm 25 13.32 9094301 | 32 SYSCO
SWISS CHEESE SLICED USDA APPROVED 4cs 8/1.25% GVEMETRO /1.5 LB N 32 | UsFoods
YOGURT, DANIMALS 40Z DANNON 140Cs | s240z DANIMALS 84 OF 1asa | os7razy 32 | USFoods
YOGURT, STRAW/BAN/RASP CRMY BLEND DANNON 140cs | sa40z Dannon 4804 0z 16.49 7849706 32 SYSCO
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YOGURT, .w._.xb,<<\_um>OI LITE MINI DANNON 140 CS .M#\# OZ Dannon 24/4 oz 8.23 . WmmONNV 32 SYSCO
YOGURT, STRAW/PEACH LITE MINI DANNON 140CS | 24140z LIGHTREIT 2414 OZ s 602! osssezs | 32 | USFoods
BUTTER SALTED Trans Fat Free 15Cs 0% | GLNVW FRMS 671 LB s  ssss| 77506 3 | USFoods
LIQUID MARGARINE FIRST QUALITY Trans Fat Free sCS 411 GAL s 41 GA s 1s8s| 703504 33 | US Foods
|MARGARINE CUPS GOLD-N OR = Trans fat Free 30CS 900.CT GLNVW FRMS 005 GR s 1a00| 708512 3 |- US Foods
MARGARINE REDD S0CT _HOW._-__u_m_U. Trans Fat Free 200CS 123 Whifarm 24 # 24.42 9364449 33 SYSCO
MARGARINE SOLIDS FORTIFIED-NOT A BLEND Trans fat Fn 40CS wO\A% admiration $19.50 25370 33 Ginsbergs
WHIPPED TOPPING AEROSOL, RICH OR = 10CS 12/140Z m.\.wN 0zZ . . 12/14 oz 22.44 9814583 33 SYSCO
EGG BEATER LOW CHOL LOW FAT TYPE PRODUCT 3CS 15/2# Classic 12/2 # 50.18 2580728 34 . SYSCO
EGGS COOKED PEELED 15 DOZ 60CS- | 4136CT | o v FRMS 12102 s et 607428 34 | US Foods
EGGS FRESH USDA GRADE A, FANCY- MEDIUM 40CS 30 DOZ - Classic 30 dozen 24.21 2105765 34 | svsco
EGGS LIQUID WHOLE ULTRA PASTER /ASEPTIC 100 CS 1572 GLNVW FRMS.. (502 LB s 4sos| sszma 34 | USFoods
EGGS WHOLE DICED FRZ 25CS 458 GLNVW FRMS 45 LB s  aces| esetss | 3 | UsFoods
GARLIC CHOPPED, IN WATER NO GLASS JARS 3cs 6/32 0z MONARCH 532 0Z s 176e|. 3330487 34 | USFdods
MACARONI SALAD 1ST QUALITY 10Cs 101B CROSS VALY B LB s 1701| : 42667 34 | USFoods
PASTA SALAD 50CS 45 CROSS VALY 2518 $  1463| 422048 34 | USFoods
POTATO & EGG SALAD- KENT OR = 30CS 10 0B |  cRoSSVALY 28 LB s 1087]  aooeve 34 | US Foods
RED POTATO SALAD 60 CS 248#, CROSS VALY 2/8 LB $ - 2040] 422691 34 | USFoods
BACON LAYOUT PORK SLCD26/30 CT SMTHFLD/= 10CS 1518 Morrell 154 31.64 2458263 35 SYSCO
BOLOGNA, ALL BEEF-DUBUQU OR = . 700 LB BLB  fireig _— - 53538 35 | Ginsbergs
BOLOGNA, TURKEY BILMAR OR = 100 LB 4/5% Classic 2/5 5. 1.292 4812400 35 SYSCO
CHICKEN PATTIES WHITE MEAT FULLY CKD BRN 20¢cs | 16030z Gdsource - 160/3 oz 4657 7610142 35 SYSCO
DELI TURKEY THNTRIM RMESTYEE TURKEY BRETOR | 0 26F |oa reerbornocd o o oo 55 | Ginsberge
FRANKS ALL BEEF 8/# FARMLAND OR = 2000 LB 1018 PATUXENT oLB ls  1s74| 7330095 35 | USFoods
FRANKS ALL BEEF 8# NATHANS 30CS 10¢ | othan $36.75 54888 35 | Ginsbergs
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FRANKS CHICKEN 8/1# CAROLINA OR= . 1000 LB 10LB Jenneio 208 - 28.60 7497134 35 sysco X

| GARDEN VEGE PATTIES RTS MORNINGSTAR OR = 15CS. 8025 |4 pracger 64125 $36.75 54306 35 | Ginsbergs X

*|HAM LOW SODIUM EXCELLENT DELI SLICING MEAT 250 LB 3/0#  Matfeld 2111% 4137 0389548 * | 35 sysco X

"] FAM LOW SODIUM EXCELLENT DELI SLICING MEAT 250 LB. 3/0# HORMEL R P - 35 | USFoods = X .

“|UVERWURST -SUPTRV OR = 60LB sLB hatfield . 36H 1.53% -56248 35 Ginsbergs X
LUNCHEON LOAF HORMEL OR = 100 LB 10 LB Russer 6.5# 2.667 1958628 35 SYSCO X
SALAMI COOKED BIL MAR Om,u 100 _..m 13 LB farmiand - 1110# N..Nm% mmwﬂ.m . 35 Ginsbergs X
TURKEY HAM BIL MAR OR= 500 LBS 1418 | o o7 58 ' o5t 55302 3 | Ginsbergs X
APPLE JUICE IND HONEY CONSIST RESOURCE/= 200 Om. 2414 OZ Imperial #m\.b oz 18.69 . 0238006 36 SYSCO X
APPLE JUICE IND NECTAR CONSIST RESRCE/= 270Cs | 24140z Imperial 4840z 18.23 0237693 | 36 sysco X
COFEEE DECAF IND HONEY CONSIST RESRCE/= 208 75125 THICK & ES S P 36 | USFoods X
COFFEE DECAF IND NECTAR CONSIST RESRCE/= 268 75012 THICK & ES ss12GR  |s 268 | 5272497 36 | USFoods X
ICE CREAM PLUS GHOCOLATE, RESOURCE/= 12C8 48/4.5 MAGIC CUP 4814 02 s s228| se68702 3 | USFoods.  X.
ICE CREAM PLUS VANILLA, RSOURCE/= 12CS | -48/4.50Z Sys Imp | 48/4.502 2571 2291808 36 svsco X
ICED TEA IND HONEY CONSISTENCY RESRCE/= 50 CS 241402 oo ..m.uo_.. §11.95 86012 3% | Ginsbergs X
ICED TEA IND NECTAR CONSISTENCY RESRCE/= 80.CS 2414 0Z THICK & ES s5126r  |s  2616|  azesos % | USFoods X
JUICE CRNBRY COCKTAIL IND HONEY CONSIST 250Cs | 2410z Imperial 48/4 02 17.21 0238030 36 sysco X
JUICE CRNBRY COCKTAIL IND NEGTAR CONSIS 270cs | 241402 Imperial slhor 17.08 0237735 36 svsco X
JUICE ORANGE IND NECTAR CONSISTENCY | 100cs | 2440z THICK & ES ssoz  |s 77| 4zsserz 3 | USFoods X
JUIGE ORANGE IND HONEY CONSISTENCY 100cs | 24i40z THICK & ES 2414 OF s S 3 | USFoods X
MILK 2% IND HONEY CONSISTENGY RESOURCE/= 160CSs | 245807 Imperial 24/8 oz | 1807 0429357 36 sysco X
MILK 2% IND NECTAR CONSISTENCY RESRCE/= s0cs | 2450z Imperial 2418 o2 17.60 0429274 36 svsco X
WATER IND HONEY CNSTNCY RESOURCE/= 100cs | 2410z Imperial 484 oz 15.14 0238097 3 | sysco X
WATER IND NECTAR CONSISTENCY RESRCE/= 30CS 24/40Z imperial 4814 0z 14.92 0237768 36 svsco X

GINSBERG'S




