



State of New York
County of Broome Government Offices

Division of Purchasing

Jason T. Garnar, County Executive · Robin Laabs, Director

Notice of Bid Award

February 12, 2021

Whom It May Concern,

This shall advise you that on February 10, 2021, the Board of Acquisition and Contract approved the following:

Bid Title: Purchase and Delivery of Pesticides, Plant Growth Regulators, Grass Seed & Sod
Bid #: 2020-055
CA #: 8-593
Term: 02/01/2021-01/31/2022
Amount: Per Attached

Purchase order(s) will be forthcoming upon receipt of a certificate of insurance in compliance with the insurance requirements as stated in the specifications. **Incorrect insurance certificates will cause delays in payment.**

If you have not submitted the proper insurance certificate, please send a copy to Thomas Dellapenna, Risk Manager, Broome County Office of Risk Management, County Office Building, 3rd Floor, 60 Hawley Street, P.O. Box 1766, Binghamton, NY 13902-1766. Phone: (607) 778-2402 Fax #: (607) 778-6009
IMPORTANT: Please include the bid title and bid number on the insurance certificate.

Very truly yours,

Robin Laabs
Director

cc: Anthony Chapman, En-Joie Golf Course
Jeanne Bourque, Risk
Purchasing, Bid File

Awarded Vendors

Andre & Son, Inc.
17150 SR 706
Montrose, PA 18801
Phone: 570-278-1131
Fax: 570-278-3835
E-mail: standre@andreandson.com

First Turf & Ornamental
3349 Monroe Ave #290
Rochester, NY 14618
Phone: 585-734-3474
E-mail: scott@ftodistributors.com

Fisher & Son
110 Summit Dr.
Exton, PA 19341
Phone: 314-486-0480
Fax: 610-363-0563
E-mail: mweber@fisherandson.com

Harrell's LLC
5105 New Tampa Highway Lakeland, FL 33815
Phone: 863-687-2774
Fax: 863-904-1540
E-mail: bids@harrells.com

Helena Agri
312 Seneca Lane
Evans City, PA 16033
Phone: 315-521-3301
Fax: 724-538-3576
E-mail: rossw@helenaagri.com

Nutrien Ag Solutions
1173 Pittsfield-Victor Rd. Suite 110 Pittsford, NY 14534
Phone: 315-332-0909
Fax: 315-483-6743
E-mail: dean.newton@nutrien.com

Seeton / Noble Turf
25 Roland Ave.
Mt. Laurel, NJ 08054
Phone: 856-273-5939
Fax: 856-273-0998
E-mail: finance@nobleturf.com

SiteOne Landscape Supply
1385 East 36th street
Cleveland, OH 44114
Phone: 216-706-9250
Fax: 248-581-1433
E-mail: bids@SiteOne.com

En-Joie Golf Club: Bid Awards

2/1/2021 RFB-2020-055

Exp. 1/31/2022

* symbol indicates substitutes awarded.

Item	Brand Name	Unit	Unit Price	Awarded Vendor
I. Fungicides:				
A.	Turfcide	5 gallon case	\$285.30	Andre and Son Inc Harrell's Seeton/Noble Turf Site One Landscapes First Turf
B.	Insignia SC Intrinsic	4x30.5 oz. case	\$1,799.52 Agency	Andre and Son Inc Nutrien Ag Harrell's Seeton/Noble Turf Site One Lanscapes First Turf Helena
C.	Daconil Action	5 gallon case	\$405.00 Agency	Andre and Son Inc Nutrien Ag Harrell's First Turf Fisher and Son Helena
	Weatherstick	5 gallon case	\$320.00 Agency	Harrell's First Turf Fisher and Son Helena
	* Initiate 720	5 gallon case	\$149.00 low bid	Nutrien Ag
D.	Chipco 26GT	5 gallon case	\$1,074.66 low bid	Harrell's
	*QP Ipro 2	5 gallon case	\$250.00 low bid	Andre and Son Inc
E.	Banner Maxx	2 gallon case	\$436.00 Agency	Andre and Son Inc Nutrien Ag Harrell's First Turf Fisher and Son Helena
	*Lesco Spectator Ultra	2 gallon case	\$124.00 low bid	Site One Landscapes
	E. Banner Maxx	5 gallon case		No Bid
	*Primera One Prop 14.3	5 gallon case	\$190.00 low bid	Andre and Son Inc
F.	Posterity XT	5 gallon case	\$1,125.00 Agency	Andre and Son Inc Nutrien Ag Harrell's First Turf Fisher and Son Helena

G. Cleary's 3336 F * Talaris 4.5 F	5 gallon case 5 gallon case	\$468.75 low bid \$180.40 low bid	First Turf Helena
H. Instrata	5 gallon case * \$690.00/cs if order 5 plus cases	\$810.00 Agency	Andre and Son Inc Nutrien Ag Harrell's Site One Landscapes First Turf Fisher and Son Helena
I. Medallion SC	2 gallon case	\$1,140.00 Agency	Andre and Son Inc Nutrien Ag Harrell's Site One Landscapes First Turf Fisher and Son Helena
J. Heritage Action	1 pound	\$333.00 Agency	Andre and Son Inc Nutrien Ag Harrell's First Turf Fisher and Son Helena
K. Emerald	4.9 pound case	\$1,053.50 Agency	Andre and Son Inc Nutrien Ag Harrell's Seeton/Noble Turf Site One Landscapes First Turf Fisher and Son Helena
L. Segway	39.2 oz bottle	\$415.00 low bid	Andre and Son Inc Nutrien Ag Harrell's Seeton/Noble Turf Site One Landscapes First Turf Fisher and Son Helena
M. Banol * Proplant	1 gallon 1 gallon	\$482.95 low bid \$270.00 low bid	Helena Andre and Son Inc
N. Xzemplar	2 x 114oz case	\$2,952.60 Agency	Andre and Son Inc Nutrien Ag Harrell's Seeton/Noble Turf

Site One Landscapes
 First Turf
 Fisher and Son
 Helena

O. Signature XTRA 22 pound case \$700.00 Agency Andre and Son Inc
 Nutrien Ag
 Harrell's
 Seeton/Noble Turf
 Site One Landscapes
 Fisher and Son
 Helena

P. Prostar 70 WDG 12 pound case \$641.52 low bid Nutrien Ag

Q. Torque 4 gallon case No Bid
 * QP Tebuconazole 3.6 4 gallon case \$196.00 low bid Andre and Son Inc

R. Secure 5 gallon case \$3,085.00 Agency Harrell's
 First Turf
 Fisher and Son
 *Fluazinam 40SC Select 5 gallon case \$1,493.75 low bid Nutrien Ag
 * Secure Action 2.5 gallons \$1,625.00 Agency Andre and Son Inc
 Nutrien Ag
 Harrell's
 First Turf
 Fisher and Son
 Helena

S. Maxtima 4X26 oz \$769.60 Agency Andre and Son Inc
 Nutrien Ag
 Harrell's
 Seeton/Noble Turf
 First Turf
 Fisher and Son
 Helena

II. Insecticides

A. Triple Crown Golf 1 gallon \$260.00 Agency Andre and Son Inc
 Nutrien Ag
 Harrell's
 Seeton/Noble Turf
 Site One Landscapes
 First Turf
 Fisher and Son
 Helena

B. Conserve SC 1 gallon \$439.96 low bid Nutrien Ag

C. Sevin SL 5 gallon case \$215.00 low bid Andre and Son Inc
 * Carbaryl 4L 5 gallon case \$199.95 low bid Nutrien Ag

D. Scimitar GC 8 quart case \$1,196.00 low bid Helena

*Lambda Select	8 quart case	\$179.98 low bid	Nutrien Ag
E. Acelepryn	4x.5 gallon case	\$4,126.00 Agency	Andre and Son Inc Nutrien Ag Site One Landscapes First Turf Fisher and Son Helena
	* \$3,718.00/cs if order 5 plus cases		Nutrien Ag
F. Dylox 420 SL	5 gallon case	\$343.00 low bid	Andre and Son Inc
G. Provaunt	72 oz. bottle	\$381.60 Agency	Andre and Son Inc Nutrien Ag Harrell's First Turf
H. Dursban	5 gallon case		No Bid
* Chlorpyrifos 4E	5 gallon case	\$271.50 low bid	Site One Landscapes

III. Herbicides:

A. Banvel	5 gallon case	\$216.00 low bid	First Turf
* Rifle	5 gallon case	\$249.95 low bid	Nutrien Ag
B. Speedzone Red	5 gallon case	\$397.50 low bid	First Turf
*Speedzone EW	5 gallon case	\$402.00 low bid	Andre and Son Inc Nutrien Ag Seeton/Noble Turf Fisher and Son
C. Roundup Pro	5 gallon case	\$110.00 low bid	Andre and Son
*Mad Dog Plus	5 gallon case	\$67.45 low bid	Nutrien Ag
D. Dimension 2EW	5 gallon case	\$1,077.50 low bid	Nutrien Ag Harrell's Seeton/Noble Turf Site One Landscapes First Turf Fisher and Son Helena
E. Quick Silver	8 oz. bottle	\$129.99 low bid	Nutrien Ag
F. Tupersan WP	48 pound case	\$474.60 low bid	Seeton/Noble Turf
G. Lontrel	32 oz. bottle	\$137.89 low bid	Nutrien Ag
H. Drive	64 oz. bottle	\$41.02 low bid	Nutrien Ag
I. Sedge Hammer	1.3 oz. bottle	\$43.74 low bid	Nutrien Ag
J. Tenacity	1 gallon	\$775.00 Agency	Andre and Son Inc

Nutrien Ag
 Harrell's
 Site One Landscapes
 First Turf
 Fisher and Son
 Helena

IV. Plant Growth Reg.

A. Primo Maxx	10 gallon link	\$2,740.00 Agency	Andre and Son Inc Harrell's Site One Landscapes First Turf Fisher and Son Helena
* Game Up	10 gallons	\$999.99 low bid	Nutrien Ag
B. Primo Maxx	2 gallon case	\$580.00 Agency	Andre and Son Inc Harrell's Site One Landscapes First Turf Fisher and Son
* QP T-Nex	2 gallon case	\$195.00 low bid	Andre and Son Inc
C. Proxy	5 gallon case	\$173.00 low bid	Andre and Son Inc
D. Anuew	1.5lb package	\$108.90 Agency	Andre and Son Inc Nutrien Ag Harrell's Seeton/Noble Turf Site One Landscapes First Turf Fisher and Son Helena
E. Trimmit 2SC	5 gallon case	\$2,125.00 Agency	Andre and Son Inc Harrell's Site One Landscapes First Turf Fisher and Son
*Tide Paclo 2SC	5 gallon case	\$741.35 low bid	Nutrien Ag

V. Seed and Fertilizer

*A. 3 Way Bentgrass	Price per pound	\$4.60 low bid	Andre and Son Inc
*B. GLS Resistent	Price per pound	\$1.39 low bid	Nutrien Ag
C. L-93 Bentgrass	Price per pound	\$7.02 low bid	Harrell's
*D. Creeping Bentgrass	Price per pound	\$5.99 low bid	Nutrien Ag
E. Silical AS			No Bid
F. Early Bird 3-0-1			No Bid

G. 30-0-20 Tyler Bent Sp	25 pound bag	\$24.25 low bid	Andre and Son Inc
*H. 30-0-10 CC 50%MESA	50 pound bag	\$28.45 low bid	Nutiren Ag
*I. 18-0-14 60% Nutralene 90 SGN	50 pound bag	\$48.00 low bid	Site One Lanscapes
*J. Rough Mix	Price per pound	\$1.58 low bid	Andre and Son Inc
K. 21-0-0 Amm. Sul. Mini	50 pound bag	\$14.00 low bid	Seeton/Noble Turf
*L. 41-0-0 Mini Polyon	50 pound bag	\$52.38 low bid	Harrell's
M. 21-0-0 Soluble Lesco	50 pound bag	\$23.85 low bid	Site One Landscapes
*N. 13-0-26 Micro Polyon	50 pound bag	No Bid	No Bid
*13-0-26 Mutech		\$56.00 low bid	Seeton/Noble Turf
O. 28-0-3 Dimension/Acelep	50 pound bag	\$79.25 low bid	Helena
*24-0-8		\$61.50 low bid	First Turf
*32-0-5		\$67.00 low bid	Nutrien Ag
P. Defoamer	Per 1 gallon	\$20.00 low bid	Seeton/Noble Turf
Q. Turf Marking Foam	Per 1 quart	\$8.00 low bid	Nutrien Ag
R. Iron Sulfate	50 pound bag	\$17.20 low bid	Nutrien Ag
*S. Turf Screen	5 gallon case	\$530.00 low bid	Andre and Son Inc
*Sarge	5 gallon case	\$499.00 low bid	Nutrien Ag
T. 9-0-18 Andersons	40 pound bag	\$52.90 Agency	Andre and Son Inc Nutiren Ag Seeton/Noble Turf
U. Black Pond Dye	6 x 5.25oz	\$84.08 low bid	Harrell's
*Black Onyx	4 gallon case	\$315.00 low bid	Seeton/Noble Turf
V. 18-0-18 Andersons	40 pound bag	\$53.30 Agency	Andre and Son Inc Nutiren Ag Seeton/Noble Turf
W. Pigment Cleaner	4 gallon case	\$153.07 low bid	Harrell's
	*12x32oz case	\$105.00 low bid	First Turf
VI. Wetting Agent			
*A. Cascade Plus	5 gallon case		No Bid
*B. Duplex Ultra	5 gallon case		No Bid
*C. Retaining Pellets	Per 8oz pellet	\$8.00 low bid Aqua Aid	Andre and Son Inc